

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
3rd grade girls	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference & Consequences	McCorkle	
5th Grader	11/13/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative circle on fighting	McCorkle	
8th Grade Girls	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Respecting and following classroom rules	McCorkle	
A. Burrola	10/20/2014	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle	LSC met with principal regarding Restorative Circle with and held on 10-16-14 per AP request on 101-13-14	THMS	
A. Burrola	10/31/2014	8	B/D - Restorative Circle	Meeting with students with conflict issues all day	THMS	
A. Burrola	11/4/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Assisting students with conflict situations	THMS	
A. Burrola	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met with PE classroom teacher Ms. P	THMS	
A. Burrola	11/5/2014	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle	Per AP direction Mr. Armendariz	THMS	
A. Burrola	11/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Campus email to present THMS Matrix to our entire staff and invite a new committee for PBIS	THMS	
A. Burrola	10/22/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Conflict with fellow student during 1st lunch period today. Student	THMS	
A.burrola	11/20/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Present at meeting were: Equity specialist Mr. Kelly, Behavior specialist, Monique Landrum, Drop Out Specialist, Jeff, LSC Mr. Burrola, three students.	THMS	
A.G. - Mr. Muller	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Attendance Issue - parent contact	McCorkle	
A.Mendoza	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference on being disrespectful and disruptive in class.	McCorkle	
Aaron Coleman	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 students (friends) had a disagreement and shoving match.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/24/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student services referral screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/27/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Referral screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Biology teacher, myself and 2 continually disruptive students.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/31/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Students sited as diversion during theft at local gas station.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/31/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Documentation and filing of paper referrals.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/3/2014	4.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Class observation: 4th period 10th grade English	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Afterschool Character Education	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/4/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice	Referral screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/5/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student services referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Student, parent, teacher, LSC, Dropout prevention conference.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	5th Period Geometry Classroom Observation	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/12/2014	7	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student services behavioral referral screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Junior male and freshman male regarding threats to sister.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Afterschool Character Education	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/13/2014	7	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student services referral screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle	2 sisters, 1 frosh and 1 senior with a former female senior friend.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/14/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student services referral screening for disruptive behavior.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Freshman female friends had a heated argument.	Santa Rita High School	
Aaron Coleman	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Afterschool Character Education for 2 male students	Santa Rita High School	
Aaron Coleman	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	ACR English Resource teacher, myself and 2 students	Santa Rita High School	
Aaron Coleman	11/17/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services Referral Screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Afterschool Character Education	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/18/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services Referral Screenings	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	A couple different male to male situations	SRHS	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Aaron Coleman	11/19/2014	4.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student services referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/20/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services behavioral referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/21/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services behavior referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/24/2014	8	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	11/25/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services referral screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/20/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Discipline Screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/21/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Discipline Screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/22/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice	Discipline Screening	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/22/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	TPD Consult	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	12/2/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Afterschool character education	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	12/2/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student services referral screenings.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	12/3/2014	8	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services Referral Screening.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	12/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Afterschool Character Education/detention for 3 students.	SRHS	
Aaron Coleman	10/23/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Services Referral Screening	SRHS	
Amundson, Cindy	1/8/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/9/2015	1.5	Select a Function	PD	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	1/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Teacher
Amundson, Cindy	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Parent
Amundson, Cindy	1/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Teacher
Amundson, Cindy	1/29/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	recognition for credit earned	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	STOM Breakfast	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	2/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	earned credit	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	2/17/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	credit earned	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	2/19/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	student of month breakfast	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/5/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness Week	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness Week	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/11/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Kindness week activities	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/12/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Kindness cards	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/23/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Amundson, Cindy	4/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/2/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student of Month Breakfast	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/20/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	5/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Kwanis Student of the Year Awards Breakfast	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	5/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Nachos at lunch	Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	5/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Amundson, Cindy	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	Student
Andrea Valenzuela	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	with a class	THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/8/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/9/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/11/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/15/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andrea Valenzuela	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		THMS	
Andres Burrola	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	Met with teacher who was prepared to make a referral Teacher Mr. Mock	THMS	
Arvayo, Natasha	3/2/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/4/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Teacher
Arvayo, Natasha	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Other (Please
Arvayo, Natasha	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/24/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Other (Please
Arvayo, Natasha	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Arvayo, Natasha	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Natasha	5/14/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/23/2015	3	Select a Function		McCorkle	Other (Please
Arvayo, Sonia	1/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/26/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/27/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Honor Assemble for K-5th	McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	1/30/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Honors Assembly for 6th - 8th	McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	2/3/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	2/4/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Select Your School	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	2/5/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	2/6/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	2/9/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	2/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	3/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	3/26/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	3/31/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	4/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Select Your School	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	4/27/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	New Tech Network Teacher Residency - Cultural Outcomes Professional Development	McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	4/28/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	New Tech Network Teacher Residency - Mindset/Cultural Outcome workshop	McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	4/30/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Monthy award assembly	McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	5/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	5/8/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Recognition		McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	5/19/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Award Assemblies	McCorkle	Student
Arvayo, Sonia	5/21/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	8th Grade Promotions and celebration	McCorkle	Student
B Boschert	11/3/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus LSASP	
B Boschert	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Core Plus LSASP	
B Boschert	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus LSASP	
B Boschert	11/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus LSASP	
B Boschert	11/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus LSASP	
B Boschert	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus LSASP	
B Boschert	12/4/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus and LSASP	
B Boschert	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Core Plus and LSASP	
B Boschert	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Core Plus and LSASP	
B Boschert	12/11/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus and LSASP	
B. Boschert	10/28/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus LSASP	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
B. Boschert	10/29/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	11/12/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus-LSASP	
B. Boschert	11/12/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	11/13/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	11/17/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	11/18/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus LSASP	
B. Boschert	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Consulted with Ins Spc re:progress of PBIS in classroom	Core Plus LSASP	
B.S.	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Incident on cutting and cyber bullying	McCorkle	
Banks	12/3/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	
Batty, Emma	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/16/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/21/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/22/2015	3.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Print Shop Design	Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/23/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/26/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/26/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning Math and Science Night	Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	1/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	1/28/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Batty, Emma	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/5/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Teacher
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Batty, Emma	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Other (Please
Batty, Emma	1/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/20/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/20/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	2/25/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/27/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/31/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/31/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	3/31/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Batty, Emma	4/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/29/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/8/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/12/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/13/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	CPS/Police	Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	5/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Batty, Emma	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Parent
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	Student
Batty, Emma	5/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	Student
BBoschert	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Core Plus LSASP	
BBoschert	12/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus and LSASP	
BBoschert	12/16/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus and LSASP	
BBoschert	12/17/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus and LSASP	
BBoschert	12/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus and LSASP	
BBoschert	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bednar, Ilsa	1/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning for 5th Grade Peer Mediators	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	1/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Worked with small group of students who will make presentation on Responsible Behaviors	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Worked with 5th grade students to train as Playground Peer Mediators	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Pictures of Students of the week	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met w/ parent about concerns over students' behavior	Howell	Parent
Bednar, Ilsa	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Prep for Boys' Friendship Group	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Boys' Friendship Group	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Training Peer Mediators	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/26/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/26/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Review information related to student incident; Social Thinking materials for students lacking empathy	Howell	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Met w/ principal about student incident, follow up	Howell	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow up on Rest. Conference	Myers-Ganoung	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow up with two boys from Rest. Conference	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	2nd/3rd Grade Boys' Group	Howell	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Bednar, Ilsa	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning/Communication about Referrals for Peer Mentors	Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	2/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	2nd/3rd Grade Boys' Friendship Group	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Bathroom Inspections	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow up with teachers about students	Myers-Ganoung	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	In class support	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning w/ counselor for Rest. Circle for 4th grade girls	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/16/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Communication to PBS Team, Bathroom Ratings tallied	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	2/17/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	2nd/3rd Boys' Behavior Intervention Group	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/17/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/18/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow up w/ Teachers about Student Rest. Conferences	Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Myers-Ganoung	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	2/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Scheduling Conference for student on 3 day suspension	Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/23/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Planning & Communication	Myers-Ganoung	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	2/23/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Howell Hawk Mentors - 5th graders working w/ 1st & 2nd graders	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Myers-Ganoung	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	3/2/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/2/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	3/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning for Boys' Friendship Group	Howell	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	3/3/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/3/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/4/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/10/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	info about student bullying incident	Howell	Other (Please
Bednar, Ilsa	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Howell	Parent
Bednar, Ilsa	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Mentoring	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Howell	Parent

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Bednar, Ilsa	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Parent
Bednar, Ilsa	3/24/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Howell	Parent
Bednar, Ilsa	3/24/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	FAST Group from Rincon meets w/ Boys' Friendship Group	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Parenting Class	Howell	Parent
Bednar, Ilsa	4/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Pre-Conference	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	4/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow up meeting with teachers of student	Howell	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	4/14/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Planning for 5th Grade Mentors end of year event	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	4/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	5th Grade Mentors	Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/4/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Myers-Ganoung	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Myers-Ganoung	Teacher
Bednar, Ilsa	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	Student
Bednar, Ilsa	5/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	Student
Bernadette Boscher	12/1/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	11/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	11/24/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	11/21/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	11/19/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	11/19/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus and LSASP	
Bernadette Boscher	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Core Plus and LSASP	
Boschert, Bernadet	1/7/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	1/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	1/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	1/13/2015	1.5	Select a Function	Recruiting for Program	Core Plus	Other (Please
Boschert, Bernadet	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	1/15/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	1/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	1/27/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	1/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	1/29/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	2/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	2/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	2/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	2/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	2/6/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Boschert, Bernadet	2/13/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	3/5/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	3/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	3/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	3/23/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	3/25/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	3/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	4/2/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	4/21/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	4/22/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	4/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Core Plus	Teacher
Boschert, Bernadet	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/8/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/14/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Core Plus	Student
Boschert, Bernadet	5/14/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Core Plus	Student
Bruce Williams	10/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Return from suspension	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	10/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	@ students return from suspension	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Pre Conference 2 Students	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	2 students R/S regarding mulpile issues- confrentation	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with student on a return from suspension issue	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with 2 students RE: Return from suspension	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet w/ Ms. Ronsman RE: Student support in classroom situation	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two Students 1. Return from Suspension 2. Student- Teacher	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	11/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Teacher Colaberation and positive reinforcement	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with Mom of and her Sabino Counselor RE classroom situations	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	MTSS Student sent out of Class	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	met with 3 seperate students RE: Return from Suspension	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/1/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with 3 seperate students Return from Suspensions	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/1/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met withDad of discussed Restorative and progress or lack of in situation	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/1/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Met with teacher about student disruption and expectations of Ex Ed student	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/3/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with 3 students on their return from suspension	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/12/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Helping 2 students who returned from Suspension &	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	work to stop harassmt two students picking on another student	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/15/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with 2 return from Suspension girls and worked with a student who would not give his teacher his cell phone	Sabino	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Bruce Williams	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with [redacted] on return from school also meet with 3 other students trying to help them with problems with situations in the classromm	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Working with [redacted] an MTSS student	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	1/5/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with 4 returning students and 2 girls who were in a conficlt	Sabino	
Bruce Williams	10/23/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Three Girls	Sabino	
Buchanan, Wanda	1/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference with [redacted] and [redacted]	Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Conducted a Restorative Circle in a 5th Grade Class.	Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/14/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/16/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/26/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/29/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/2/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/3/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/3/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/3/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Buchanan, Wanda	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/12/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Naylor	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Buchanan, Wanda	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	4/29/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/4/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Other (Please
Buchanan, Wanda	5/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/14/2015	1	Select a Function		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/19/2015	0	Select a Function		Cholla	Student
Buchanan, Wanda	5/21/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cholla	Student
C.A.	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Disruptive behavior in class	McCorkle	
C.A. & B.G.	10/22/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Behavioral Incentive support	McCorkle	
Carol Thomas	10/2/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/14/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/14/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Johnson	
Carol Thomas	11/19/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/19/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/1/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Johnson	
Carol Thomas	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/2/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Johnson	
Carol Thomas	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lawrence	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Carol Thomas	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/9/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/11/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Data Collection	Lawrence	
Carol Thomas	12/16/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Johnson	
Carol Thomas	12/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lawrence	
Carol Wilson	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	10/20/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Social counseling	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	10/20/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Individual concerns with another student	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	10/20/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Parent phone Conference regarding student behavior	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	10/29/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Honor Roll Assembly	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/3/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent conference along with discussion and plan with student	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Bullying and cutting concerns	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Individual conference regarding behavior	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Discipline Referral- fight	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Crisis Intervention with CPS	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/6/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Practice	Parent conference regarding Academic Support	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conflict mediation	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/7/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conflict Mediation	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	To alleviate potential fight	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/7/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conflict mediation	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	10/21/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conflict mediation	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/10/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Parent conference regarding student and bullying	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/10/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Phone conversation with parent regarding student conduct	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/10/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference	Parent Meeting regarding student who is hurting herself	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Conflict Mediation with students	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/13/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Formal Restorative Conference with parents and students regarding Bullying accusations	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student self Mutalating..parent meeting and community resources contacted	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	discipline Referral to LSC	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Individual Conference with student in crisis	Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	12/2/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	
Carol Wilson	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mansfeld	
Chandler, Kathleen	1/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Teacher
Chandler, Kathleen	1/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Chandler, Kathleen	1/8/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/12/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/23/2015	2.5	Select a Function	UVA 90 Plan Review w/ Jana Acevedo and John Black	Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/26/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/26/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/27/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/28/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/29/2015	3	Select a Function	UVA Admin Meeting	Cavett	Teacher
Chandler, Kathleen	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Parent
Chandler, Kathleen	1/29/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/30/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	1/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/4/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Parent
Chandler, Kathleen	2/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Parent
Chandler, Kathleen	2/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/13/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Chandler, Kathleen	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	4/12/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/19/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/23/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/24/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	2/25/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	Student
Chandler, Kathleen	3/6/2015	2	Select a Function		Cavett	Student
Christiane Hennin	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	10/13/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	awareness session for students re: new cafeteria expectations and at dismissal	Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	10/14/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Continued awareness of cafeteria behavioral expectations	Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	10/15/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Continued monitoring cafeteria behavior	Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	11/17/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Reviewing cafeteria expectations with students	Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Checking on cafeteria behavior to prevent bullying	Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	11/26/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Fruchthendler	
Christiane HENning	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	11/26/2014	3.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	monitored school for appropriate behavior in playground, cafeteria, hallways, visited classrooms; the day before a holiday, if you are not looking, things will happen!	Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/2/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/4/2014	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/11/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/15/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	
Christiane Henning	12/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	
Cindy Amundson	10/17/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Q1 Attendance credits Awards	Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/1/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/4/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student of the Month Breakfast	Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student of the Month Breakfast	Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/5/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/8/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 students	Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	dealt with 3 situations	Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Cindy Amundson	12/15/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Project MORE	
Cindy Amundson	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Project MORE	
Coleman, Aaron	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Returned runaway student after SRO consult.	Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Attendance contract for a freshman male student.	Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/9/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/13/2015	5.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Santa Rita	Parent
Coleman, Aaron	1/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	1/28/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/2/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Teacher
Coleman, Aaron	2/4/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/6/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/9/2015	6.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/10/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/11/2015	1	Select a Function	SMART Meeting	Santa Rita	Other (Please
Coleman, Aaron	2/11/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/12/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/16/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/20/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/23/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	2/24/2015	4.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	3/9/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	3/10/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	3/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	3/30/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	3/31/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/1/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/6/2015	6.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Coleman, Aaron	4/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/28/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/29/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	4/30/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	5/11/2015	1	Select a Function	ACT preliminary documentation wrap up.	Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	5/11/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	5/12/2015	4.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	5/13/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Coleman, Aaron	5/18/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/9/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	Other (Please
Cowman, Phyllis	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/13/2015	3	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Collaboration with LSC dept. on documenting PBIS lessons/making word doc of schedule	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/14/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/15/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Parent call about daughter's restorative conference	Dodge	Parent
Cowman, Phyllis	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/16/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/16/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/26/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	1/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 separate restorative conferences about peers and achievement	Dodge	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Cowman, Phyllis	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	2 circles for 2 classes	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/23/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	2/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 conferences	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	2 class circles	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	PBIS - ideas for reinforcement	Bonillas	Teacher
Cowman, Phyllis	3/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Other (Please
Cowman, Phyllis	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/11/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	(2 circles with 2 classes)	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/24/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	PD for 504 coordinators	Bonillas	Other (Please
Cowman, Phyllis	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/26/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/26/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Parent
Cowman, Phyllis	3/31/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/1/2015	3	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/7/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Cowman, Phyllis	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Parent
Cowman, Phyllis	4/8/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Teacher
Cowman, Phyllis	4/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/8/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/9/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Teacher
Cowman, Phyllis	4/10/2015	1.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Parent
Cowman, Phyllis	4/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle	4 class circles throughout day	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/13/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/13/2015	1.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	504 meeting for twins	Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/13/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/15/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Parent
Cowman, Phyllis	4/15/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/16/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	Other (Please
Cowman, Phyllis	4/16/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/17/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/17/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/20/2015	0.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/20/2015	0.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/20/2015	1.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/21/2015	3	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	2 meetings	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/22/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/23/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/23/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/23/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/23/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/23/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/24/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/27/2015	1.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/27/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	(2 class circles)	Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/29/2015	1.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/30/2015	0.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Cowman, Phyllis	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/7/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/11/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/11/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	Other (Please
Cowman, Phyllis	5/15/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/15/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/18/2015	0.75	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/20/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dodge	Student
Cowman, Phyllis	5/21/2015	0.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bonillas	Teacher
Cynthia Maxwe	11/17/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/27/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/30/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/31/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/7/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/13/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/17/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/21/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/22/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/18/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	11/25/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/22/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	12/2/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	12/8/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	12/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	1/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles ELC	
Cynthia Maxwell	1/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miles ELC	
D.A & F.G.	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	AM dispute in the playground- Name calling	McCorkle	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
D.E.	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative circle	McCorkle	
Dale Lopez	1/6/2015	5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	1/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/23/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/23/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/24/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/27/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/27/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/28/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/30/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/31/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/3/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/5/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/7/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/10/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/10/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/12/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/12/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PBIS Training at 1010	Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/13/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/17/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/19/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Dale Lopez	10/21/2014	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	10/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/2/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/2/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/5/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/8/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/8/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/9/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/9/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/9/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/10/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/11/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/12/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/15/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/15/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/15/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/16/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/19/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	12/19/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge K-8	
Dale Lopez	1/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	
Dale Lopez	1/5/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	
Dale Lopez	1/5/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	
ddietz	10/27/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	meeting with AP and student and follow up 4 students	Gridley	
ddietz	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	behavioral contract meeting	Gridley	
ddietz	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	supporting classroom management	Gridley	
ddietz	10/29/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	supporting new teachers PBIS	Gridley	
ddietz	10/30/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	PBIS positive behavior recognition	Gridley	
ddietz	10/20/2014	4	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	classroom visits Jones x2 , Orsman, Jacob, Reed and Sylvian	Gridley	
ddietz	11/3/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference	working with 5 students - logged in Mojave	Gridley	
ddietz	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	PBIS teen court	Gridley	
ddietz	11/5/2014	4.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	6 restorative sessions logged in Mojave	Gridley	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
ddietz	10/21/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	classroom visits new teacher/sub behavior coaching	Gridley	
ddietz	11/14/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	3 restorative sessions completed	Gridley	
ddietz	11/14/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	TEEN COURT	Gridley	
ddietz	11/17/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Teen court	Gridley	
ddietz	11/17/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative Sessions	Gridley	
ddietz	11/18/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	restorative - teen court prep	Gridley	
ddietz	11/20/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	restorative coferecing	Gridley	
ddietz	11/24/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	teen court 3 students	Gridley	
ddietz	10/22/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	restorative sessions/follow up with faculty	Gridley	
ddietz	11/25/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	teen court 3 cases	Gridley	
ddietz	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	teen court 9 students	Gridley	
ddietz	11/26/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	restorative conferences (4)	Gridley	
ddietz	12/1/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	teen court 5 students	Gridley	
ddietz	12/2/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Teen Court	Gridley	
ddietz	12/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 sessions	Gridley	
ddietz	12/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Teen Court and related contacts	Gridley	
ddietz	12/5/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Teen court and 2 restorative sessions	Gridley	
ddietz	12/9/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Teen Court and related	Gridley	
ddietz	12/10/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Teen Court	Gridley	
ddietz	12/15/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	restorative practice	gridley	
ddietz	12/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle	restorative circles with 2 sets of students	Gridley	
ddietz	12/18/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	intervention data compilation and analysis	Gridley	
ddietz	1/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	restorative sessions	Gridley	
ddietz	1/7/2015	3.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	3 class periods of 7th grade science - new sub support and related	Gridley	
ddietz	1/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	restorative conferences	Gridley	
ddietz	1/8/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	science 7th sub support	Gridley	
Debra Romancho	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Organized Student Recognition stickers/Printing/Principal, etc.	Gale	
Debra Romancho	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
Debra Romancho	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Award Ceremony	Gale	
Debra Romancho	11/7/2014	0.15	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Collabortion with counselor	Gale	
Debra Romancho	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Sticker Initiative	Gale	
Debra Romancho	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	
Debra Romancho	10/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Gale	
Debra Romancho	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
Debra Romancho	10/21/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Gale	
Debra Romancho	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Gale	
Debra Romancho	10/24/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Gale	
Denise Murphy	11/26/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Borman	
Denise Murphy	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Soleng Tom	
Denise Murphy	12/9/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Soleng Tom	
dietz	12/11/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	4 restorative sessions	Gridley	
Dietz, David	1/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	restorative sessions (4)	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/9/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	teaching behavior expectations to student in LA and Math 7th	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/13/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Math and Science 7th grade PBIS teacher support	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	4 sessions	Gridley	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Dietz, David	1/14/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	PBIS visits	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/16/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	PBIS classroom walkthroughs with AP and School Safety Officer	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/16/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	working on PBIS and data	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/20/2015	6	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	classroom lessons every SS class	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/26/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	5 sessions	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	1/27/2015	3	Select a Function		Select Your School	Teacher
Dietz, David	4/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	sessions with 4 students	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	4/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	meetings with students for restorative sessions	Gridley	Student
Dietz, David	4/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Teen Court	Gridley	Student
DR	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
DR	10/24/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	
DR	10/24/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	
Dustin Knippen	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/28/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/28/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/28/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/30/2014	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/3/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/3/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Dustin Knippen	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/5/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/21/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/7/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Dustin Knippen	11/20/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	11/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/1/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/23/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/5/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/5/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/6/2015	2	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	10/24/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/7/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/7/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist Middle School	
Dustin Knippen	1/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist Middle School	
Eileen Gow	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	10/30/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	10/30/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	10/31/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/3/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/7/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/12/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Eileen Gow	11/12/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/15/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/16/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/18/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/20/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/21/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	11/26/2014	3.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/10/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/11/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/15/2014	5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/17/2014	4.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/18/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	
Eileen Gow	12/18/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	Student
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/24/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student interviews	White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Behavior Mangement Plan -	White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student check-ins & classroom observation of student interactions.	White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/7/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/7/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/14/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/20/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/3/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/3/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/5/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	We also reviewed PBIS cafeteria & playground expectations.	White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/9/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/9/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/9/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/9/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/12/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/15/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/18/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	1/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriguez	1/6/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White Elementary School	
Elizabeth Rodriugez	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White Elementary School	
Emma	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/28/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/28/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/30/2014	1.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Emma Batty	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/7/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/7/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Emma Batty	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/21/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/22/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/3/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/9/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/12/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/11/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/9/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/10/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/23/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/15/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	12/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	1/5/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Kellond	
Emma Batty	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Kellond	
Emma Batty	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Kellond	
Emma Batty	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Kellond	
Evan Worthington	1/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sam Hughes	Teacher
Evan Worthington	1/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Evan Worthington	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/29/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/30/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	10/29/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/3/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/7/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/13/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/14/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/14/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/21/2014	4	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/17/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/18/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Evan Worthington	11/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/19/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/24/2014	1.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	10/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/17/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/22/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/19/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	11/25/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/26/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	11/26/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/2/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/3/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/4/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/8/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/9/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/12/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/15/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/16/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	12/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	12/19/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	1/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Hughes	
Evan Worthington	1/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	1/7/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	
Evan Worthington	1/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	
Fiene, John	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Review lunch procedure expectations	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/9/2015	0.5	Select a Function	Data Entry	Oyama	Other (Please
Fiene, John	1/9/2015	3.5	Select a Function	LSC Meeting PD	Oyama	Other (Please
Fiene, John	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Fiene, John	1/26/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative Practice Training	Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	1/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Class Behavior	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/27/2015	0.5	Select a Function	Data Entry	Drachman	Other (Please
Fiene, John	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Oyama	Parent
Fiene, John	2/2/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Oyama	Teacher
Fiene, John	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	2/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Removed student from classroom and stayed with me the rest of the afternoon	Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	3/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	3/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Drachman	Teacher
Fiene, John	3/3/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	3/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	3/24/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	3/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Select Your School	Teacher
Fiene, John	3/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	3/31/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	4/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Drachman	Teacher
Fiene, John	4/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Drachman	Teacher
Fiene, John	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Drachman	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Fiene, John	4/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	4/13/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student throwing extreme tantrum	Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/16/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	What is our revised plan going to look like for next year and how will it fit into the PLCs	Oyama	Other (Please
Fiene, John	4/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	4/23/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student was removed from class by teacher due to severe distraction	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	4/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	4/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Oyama	Teacher
Fiene, John	4/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Students were sent out of class for the remainder of day by teacher	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	4/27/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Drachman	Teacher
Fiene, John	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	Other (Please
Fiene, John	5/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/6/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	Teacher
Fiene, John	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	Revise plan and discuss with parent	Oyama	Teacher
Fiene, John	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/14/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	Teacher
Fiene, John	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Bully Prevention Program	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	Complete paperwork for 504 Plan and file	Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	Student
Fiene, John	5/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Bully Prevention Program	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/21/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Spoke with students about proper school behavior	Oyama	Student
Fiene, John	5/22/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Finalize Plan for next SY	Oyama	Teacher
Freitag, Justin	1/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	1/14/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Safford	Teacher
Freitag, Justin	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	1/16/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	Teacher
Freitag, Justin	1/29/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	1/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	2/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	2/17/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	2/18/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Safford	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Freitag, Justin	3/31/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/1/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/15/2015	8	Select a Function	AzMERIT prep	Safford	Teacher
Freitag, Justin	4/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	5/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	Student
Freitag, Justin	5/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/8/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	parent/teacher conferences	Valencia	Parent
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/9/2015	3.5	Select a Function	LSC meeting	Valencia	Other (Please
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/12/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/12/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	social contracts	Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/13/2015	2.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	1.5	Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/14/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/15/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/16/2015	2.15	Select a Function	filling in paper work for MTSS	Valencia	Teacher
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/21/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/22/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/23/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/27/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	parent / teacher conference	Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia	Student
Gabalton, Jeannett	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia	Student
Gail Masi	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Fire Drill/Bus Evacuation	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/27/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Monitoring	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/28/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	
Gail Masi	10/29/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	
Gail Masi	10/30/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Monitoring	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Monitor Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Recycling	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	November Agenda	Miller	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gail Masi	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Miller Merit Store	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/31/2014	0.15	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent Pick-Up	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/3/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/3/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Follow up 10/14 meeting and Planning 11/14 Meeting	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/3/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Individual Student Conference	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/3/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent pick-up	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before School Playgroung	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Meeting with School Resource Officer	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent Pick-Up	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before School Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/22/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Prepare Minutes from 10/15/14 PBIS Team Meeting	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent Pick-Up	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before School Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/24/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Miller Merits	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Meeting minutes	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/20/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Review of discipline data with principal	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Read a PBIS book to primary - discussed expectations	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Merit Store	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Miller Merit Store	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	
Gail Masi	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before school playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent Pick-Up	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before School Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent Pick-Up	Miller	
Gail Masi	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before School Playground	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/25/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before school playgroung/After school parent pick-up	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Inappropriate use of cell phone	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/26/2014	3.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Turkey Trot k-5/Direct parent contact	Miller	
Gail Masi	11/26/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Parent pick-up	Miller	
Gail Masi	12/1/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before school playground/after school parent pick-up	Miller	
Gail Masi	12/2/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before school playground/after school parent pick-up	Miller	
Gail Masi	12/3/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Before school playground/After school parent pick-up	Miller	
Gerhard, Trisha	1/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/15/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Parent
Gerhard, Trisha	1/16/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/20/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/22/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gerhard, Trisha	1/26/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/6/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/19/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/20/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/23/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Using Circkes effectively training	Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	2/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/9/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/12/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gerhard, Trisha	3/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	3/30/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/1/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/1/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/1/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/7/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/7/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/12/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dunham	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gerhard, Trisha	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/20/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	Student
Gerhard, Trisha	5/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	Student
Gist, Stacey	1/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	1/14/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/11/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	1/26/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	1/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	1/28/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	1/30/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Banks	Teacher
Gist, Stacey	2/3/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/4/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Parent
Gist, Stacey	2/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	2/24/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	2/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	2/25/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Parent
Gist, Stacey	3/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	3/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	3/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/4/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/10/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/11/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Banks	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gist, Stacey	3/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/30/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/31/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/31/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Vesey	Teacher
Gist, Stacey	4/2/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Parent
Gist, Stacey	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/7/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	504 Training & Compliance	Banks	Other (Please
Gist, Stacey	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	4/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/21/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	4/24/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/28/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/28/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/30/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Vesey	Other (Please
Gist, Stacey	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/4/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vesey	Parent
Gist, Stacey	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gist, Stacey	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Other (Please
Gist, Stacey	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Banks	Other (Please
Gist, Stacey	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/21/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Vesey	Student
Gist, Stacey	5/21/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Other (Please
Gow, Eileen	1/22/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Parent
Gow, Eileen	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	1/30/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/14/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/19/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/25/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	2/25/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/11/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/12/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/12/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/25/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/5/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/6/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/9/2015	4.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	4/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/5/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/6/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Gow, Eileen	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/14/2015	4.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/19/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/20/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/20/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/21/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tolson	Student
Gow, Eileen	5/21/2015	3.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tolson	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/8/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/8/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/8/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	2/16/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	two 1st graders	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/12/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	3rd graders	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	8th grader/ prevention measures	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/12/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice	3rd grader sent out of class	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/12/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle	6th graders	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/12/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle	6th graders	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	went into 6th grade to talk about bullying	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	grabber store before school	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/13/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	pulled student to talk and check on her	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	grabber store before school	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/14/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	student was sent to me	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/14/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	grabber store during lunch	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	5th grade students	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	morning grabber store	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/21/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	student in office rest of day	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/22/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/22/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	grabber store before school	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/29/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/29/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	3/5/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	3/23/2015	35	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	3/26/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	went to get rewards for assembly giveaway	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	3/26/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	3/31/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	3/31/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Conference	8th grade girls	Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	4/21/2015	0	Select a Function	sick	Hollinger	Other (Please
Grijalva, Lacey	4/28/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	4/30/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	4/28/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hollinger	Student
Grijalva, Lacey	4/29/2015	0.35	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hollinger	Student

Name	Date Work	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Grijalva, Lacey	5/18/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	time is based in 30 min ones through out the day	Hollinger	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Discussed Possible Restorative Conference w/Student	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	1/14/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	SMART Meeting - PCJCC	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Conference	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	New Student Orientation (PBIS, GSRR, etc.)	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Pima Partnership Planning Meeting	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	4/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	4/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	PP Teen Cuisine & Bike Program Presentation	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Behavior Management Plan	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Discipline/Behavior Management Plan	Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rincon	Student
Gunnels, Kathryn	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rincon	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/13/2015	3.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Planning and starting PBIS	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	planing presentation	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/14/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/15/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	creating bulletin boards and posters for school	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/16/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence	kinder student suspended- supporting student	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/20/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	preparing for new PBIS program	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/21/2015	1	Select a Function	PD Wednesday	Warren	Teacher
Hekter, Jodi	1/22/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	creating pp for Restorative Practice and MTSS	Warren	Teacher
Hekter, Jodi	1/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/4/2015	5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/6/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/9/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/16/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/17/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student

Name	Date Work P.	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Hekter, Jodi	2/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/19/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	2/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	lunch detention	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/24/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	award certificates and letters home	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/25/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	preparing for awards assembly	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/26/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	3/27/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	3rd q assembly, 3rd q awards	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	recognition bulletin board	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	bulletin board 3rd quarter awards	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/1/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/15/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	death in family of 3 students	Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Hekter, Jodi	5/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Warren	Student
Henning, Christiane	1/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	3/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	3/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	3/31/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/22/2015	1.5	Select a Function	Wed. P.D., student placement and staff meeting	Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	Student
Henning, Christiane	5/18/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fruchthendler	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wright	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Henry, Miamichelle	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	lunch buddy	Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	lunch buddy	Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/26/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/27/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/4/2015	1	Select a Function	intervention docum, email, time	Blenman	Other (Please
Henry, Miamichelle	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/13/2015	1.5	Select a Function	intervention docum, email, time	Wright	Teacher
Henry, Miamichelle	2/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	2/20/2015	4.5	Select a Function		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/23/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Wright	Teacher
Henry, Miamichelle	3/26/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/2/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/7/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	email, time entry	Wright	Other (Please
Henry, Miamichelle	4/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Henry, Miamichelle	4/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/28/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/28/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	4/30/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	meet with mother	Wright	Parent
Henry, Miamichelle	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Blenman	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wright	Student
Henry, Miamichelle	5/20/2015	1	Select a Function		Blenman	Other (Please
Hickman, Nina	1/5/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/6/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/7/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/8/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/9/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/23/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/22/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/26/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/27/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/27/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/30/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	1/30/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/3/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/16/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/5/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Ben's Bells Tile Making Workshops	Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/6/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/9/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Hickman, Nina	2/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/20/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	2/19/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Mural Installlation that promotes Kindness	Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	3/5/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Ben's Bells Mural	Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	3/6/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Bens Bells Mural	Pueblo Gardens	Student
Hickman, Nina	4/28/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Circle	Lessons	Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	5/18/2015	5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	A+ celebration and planning	Carrillo	Student
Hickman, Nina	5/19/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	Student
Hille, Tammy	11/25/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Hille, Tammy	1/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/29/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/30/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/22/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/27/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/28/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Hille, Tammy	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	1/29/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	2/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/3/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/27/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	3/31/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	4/15/2015	0.45	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	4/24/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	4/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	4/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	4/29/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/5/2015	3.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/7/2015	6	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/11/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/11/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/12/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Teacher
Hille, Tammy	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/14/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Hille, Tammy	5/14/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	Student
Hille, Tammy	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	Parent
Hoover, Liz	1/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Hoover, Liz	12/17/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	student attendance /behavior recognition	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	12/18/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	review 504 renewal dates	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/9/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	student bully issues	Select Your School	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	resolution and call to parents	Select Your School	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	students standing on toliets	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	contact parent re upcoming events/volunteering	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	caree Day phone calls	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	follow up on student reflection/ apology	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	5 student issue resolved	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	texting peer issues	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/4/2015	1	Select a Function	college to career graphic orgaizer Teso 4th 5th	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/6/2015	0	Select a Function	Personal day Off	Mission View	Other (Please
Hoover, Liz	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/9/2015	0	Select a Function		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/20/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle	Teso class meeting including principal- peers not reporting	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	meeting wth parent 504 plan	Mission View	Parent
Hoover, Liz	2/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	504 written plan, secure signatures, file in cum	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	meet with parent to review final 504 for 2 students	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	5th grade promotion planning meet with parents	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/25/2015	0.3	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	2/26/2015	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/5/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Consequence	girl gossip/boyfiends	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/5/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	issues regarding afterschool club and personal safety	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/5/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/6/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Consequence	and	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/9/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Consequence	follow up from last Friday	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PBIS show case logostics	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/12/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/12/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/23/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mission View	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Hoover, Liz	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/26/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	issue with self contained student principal out required follow up	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	new student melt down	Select Your School	Student
Hoover, Liz	4/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	meeting with parent	Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	4/1/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	4/2/2015	0.45	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mission View	Student
Hoover, Liz	4/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	meeting with parent	Mission View	Student
Ilsa Bednar	11/25/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/25/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/24/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/24/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/25/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow up from Rest. Conference previous week	Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Communication w/ teachers - Monthly Recognition	Myers-Ganoung	
Ilsa Bednar	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Circle - to build positive environment in class with long-term sub	Myers-Ganoung	
Ilsa Bednar	11/18/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Work w/ 5th graders for presentation	Myers-Ganoung	
Ilsa Bednar	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meet w/ principal to get list of students to follow up with	Myers- Ganoung	
Ilsa Bednar	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	12/1/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Behavior Intervention Support for Student(s) in MTSS	Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Prep for Kind Kids' Luncheon	Myers-Ganoung	
Ilsa Bednar	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	1/6/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Planning for Intervention group for 2nd/3rd Boys - Behavior	Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Planning for Welcome Orientation for new students this month	Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	1/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning for Peer Mentoring Program for 5th graders & younger students; Give info/applications to 5th graders	Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	1/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Rest. Conference for two students who had incident (which resulted in one student injuring another) on day care van	Howell	
Ilsa Bednar	1/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Spoke with younger student who was involved in day care van incident	Howell	
J. Mejia	10/20/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	students,	Vail	
Jan Milligan	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Talked to above student about today's aggression. We talked about how he could fix this. I brought him to another class to do work.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	I gave the GSRR presentation to a class. We applied it to Cragin's pBIS program.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	10/28/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Worked with principal to gather information on creating a positive environment (with PBIS) for Professional Development tomorrow.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/28/2014	0.75	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Gave district power point on GSRR. talked about issues students brought up concerning PBIS and restorative practices, bullying, responsibilities etc.	Sewell	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Jan Milligan	10/29/2014	0.75	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Gave district power point on GSRR. talked about issues students brought up concerning PBIS and restorative practices, bullying, responsibilities etc.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/29/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	organized kindness notes, recorded numbers, worked with students reading them during announcements, wrote encouragements on each note, returned notes to students who had earned them.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/29/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Helped principal prepare presentations on PBIS with expectations for teachers; helped to prepare and copy materials; helped to present PBIS material at PD.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/30/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Talked to principal about the incident, then the teacher, then the girls separately and lastly finished conference. The girls were able to come to a restorative conclusion.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	taught 5th graders correct PBIS hall behaviors; stayed with them until teacher could come	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Organized and counted kindness notes. Wrote notes on those that have already been read.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	I was asked to observe a student with recently appearing anger issues. He is disrupting the class. I talked to him, made a plan with him, talked to the teacher later, made a notebook for him and taught him how to use it.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	restorative questions for half an hour and then a restorative conference	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	10/20/2014	1.75	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	2 classroom presentations with circle on applying PBIS and restorative practices to Cragin	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	10/31/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	We had a PBIS assembly; organizing name drawing, giving out prizes, etc.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	10/31/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Ran PBIS cougar bucks store for rewards	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Talked to a guardian about student's adjustment concerning trauma ; will talk to student about behavior and how trauma affects behavior	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	talked to student about trauma and how it affects behavior here at school	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	2 times, talked to a student about 2 melt downs and different options (asked restorative questions)	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	talked to a boy that had been bullied; used restorative questions; in preparation for conference	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Started restorative conference by asking restorative questions before school safety arrived	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/5/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Helped students with announcing kindness notes; wrote on ones read; returned them to teacher; organized new ones	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/5/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Helped a student leave an in-house suspension room, calm down, answer restorative questions, and decide on a new room for the rest of the day	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Helped a new student from another country learn PBIS procedures for before school and at lunch	Sewell	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Jan Milligan	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	guided students reading kindness notes at announcements, wrote notes on ones read from previous days, returned to teachers, entered into mojave	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	talked to principal, then conference with principal, SPED teacher, student and myself about playground issue and disrespect; Student came up with solutions to fix problems.	Sewell	
Jan milligan	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Circle in the first grade on filling our buckets and I messages.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/7/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Trained monitors on using restorative practices on the playground. We also solved issues within an restorative framework. Talked about individual kids. Then I took their ideas to the principal.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conference between two first graders on pushing vs using words	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	10/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	I recorded kindness notes, organized them for announcements throughout week, wrote replies on each one that has been read & returned to students	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Went to a PBIS training #3 at 1010 about PBIS data and reports	Sewell/Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	coached students giving announcements about kindness notes to be read, tallied notes for monthly report, wrote encouragement on ones read last week and returned to students	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	talked to principal about lunchtime, PBIS, monitors learning PBIS, cool tools we can do	Sewell	
Jan milligan	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	talked to three children in the hall about rules on play fighting. Asked them to problem solve and fix situation.	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Helped students read kindness notes over announcements, wrote notes from me on each, returned to teachers, wrote mojave interventions	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two different restorative conferences involving 5 different students	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Removed a student from class with help, problem solved with student using restorative ?'s, called parent	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Went over forms I got at last training with principal. Discussed goals for MTSS team, needs of school, and priorities	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Worked in cafeteria teaching students PBIS expectations at lunch during dismissal. Then spoke to each monitor about our PBIS goal of how we are to leave cafeteria ; monitors need to thank students for replays	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	talked to teachers, then boys separately, then together, using restorative questions	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/14/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Worked with one boy 3 separate times, another one once. Talked about how to make a plan to change behavior. Used restorative questions.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/14/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Worked in PBIS reward store teaching two volunteers how to help	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	talked to three first graders individually and asked restorative questions, then did the conference with all three. First talked to the principal and later the teacher.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Set up for PBIS assembly when I won't be here (at Sewell)	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Helped the teacher and principal calm a student down and problem solve	Cragin	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Jan Milligan	11/18/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	helped students read kindness notes on announcements, recorded by teacher how many written, wrote notes on ones read, put data into mojave	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Brought a student to in house suspension. Asked him restorative practices question ending with how he could fix the situation and do it differently next time.	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Talked to principal and then volunteer about PBIS changes to make store run smoother and enter data into Mojave	Cragin	
Jan Milligan	11/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Helped students read kindness notes over announcements, recorded numbers for reports, put names in Mojave, wrote on each note	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	talked to various teachers and principal about before and after school procedures	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	11/26/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/23/2014	2	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Presented GSRR to two classes; talked about bullying, safety, PBIS here at Sewell, restorative practices etc	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/23/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	talked to principal about PBIS goals to talk about at upcoming MTSS meeting	Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/11/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	
Jan Milligan	12/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	
Jan Milligan	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/15/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	
Jan Milligan	12/16/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	12/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	
Jan Milligan	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	
Jan Milligan	1/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	1/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	1/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	1/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	
Jan Milligan	10/20/2014	2.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition	awards assembly (4B's, attendance, academic); cougar store with rewards for following 4 B's	Cragin	
Janet Milligan	10/21/2014	2	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	I presented the GSRR power point in 2 classrooms. The students discussed PBIS and Restorative Practices at Sewell. They asked questions about bullying, tattling vs telling, problems going home from school etc. All issues were discussed and answered.	Sewell	
Janet Milligan	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Talked to teacher, then principal, then monitors about a playground situation that needs restorative practices conference tomorrow	Cragin	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Janet Milligan	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Went through restorative questions with a student that has been suspended.	Cragin	
Janet Milligan	10/24/2014	2.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Presented GSRR to 3 different classes. Talked about how our PBIS rules apply different places including Halloween safety. Answered questions. Students shared how they apply the concepts on each slide.	Cragin	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/22/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/24/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/24/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/30/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/30/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/31/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/25/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	12/2/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	12/2/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	12/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	12/4/2014	0	B/D - Restorative Practice	2.5	Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	1/5/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	1/6/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	1/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Valencia Middle School	
Jeannette Gabaldor	1/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Valencia Middle School	
JMejia	10/29/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness club made posters, reports, officers, activities	A. Vail	
Jodi Hekter	12/2/2014	15	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	
Jodi Hekter	11/26/2014	15	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	
Jodi Hekter	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Warren	
John Fiene	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Oyama	
John Fiene	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Oyama	
John Fiene	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Oyama	
John Fiene	11/3/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
John Fiene	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	There was a misunderstanding between two students that were accused of name calling. After speaking with the students the incident never occurred as reported. Once student didn't tell the truth and was counseled about making better choices.	Drachman	
John Fiene	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	There was a misunderstanding between two students that were accused of name calling. After speaking with the students the incident never occurred as reported. One student didn't tell the truth and was counseled about making better choices.	Drachman	
John Fiene	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	
John Fiene	11/4/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Drachman	
John Fiene	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Oyama	
John Fiene	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	
John Fiene	11/14/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	
John Fiene	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Oyama	
John Fiene	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	
John Fiene	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	
John Fiene	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Drachman	
John Fiene	11/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	
John Fiene	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Oyama	
John Fiene	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Oyama	
John Fiene	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference			
John Fiene	12/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	
John Fiene	12/11/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Oyama	
John Fiene	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Oyama	
John Fiene	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Drachman	
John Fiene	12/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Monitor Cafeteria Behaviors as per PBIS Plan	Oyama	
John Fiene	12/19/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	
John Fiene	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Drachman	
John Fiene	1/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Oyama	
John Fiene	1/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Oyama	
Josephine King	10/27/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/27/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/27/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Several students with Incident	
Josephine King	10/29/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/29/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/30/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/31/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/31/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/31/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/3/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/3/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/4/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/4/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Josephine King	11/5/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/5/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/6/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Parents	Doolen	
Josephine King	10/21/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/10/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/12/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Work with store	Doolen	
Josephine King	11/13/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/13/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/14/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Thunerbird Store	Doolen	
Josephine King	11/14/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/14/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/22/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/22/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/18/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/19/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/20/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/20/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/24/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	11/26/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/1/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/20/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Practice	Check Ins	Doolen	
Josephine King	10/23/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Multiple Situations	Doolen	
Josephine King	12/2/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/4/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Student PBIS Store	Doolen	
Josephine King	12/4/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/5/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/8/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/9/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/10/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/12/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/15/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/23/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	PD with Subs for Restorative Practice	Doolen	
Josephine King	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/17/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/18/2014	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/18/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	
Josephine King	12/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Josephine King	10/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Multiple	Dollen	
Josephine King	10/24/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	Student and Teacher	Doolen	
Josephine King	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Doolen	
Josephine King	10/21/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Thunderbird Store Items	Doolen	
Joshua Payne	11/6/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sahuaro	
Joshua Payne	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sahuaro	
Joshua Payne	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sahuaro	
Joshua Payne	12/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		sahuaro	
Julei Mejia	12/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Kindness club, positive student recognition, helping family in need.	Alice Vail middle school	
Julie Meji a	12/15/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Conference	conferences with student updated review of grades, discipline, restoratove conference.	Alice Vail Middle School	
julie mejia	10/30/2014	20	B/D - Restorative Consequence	student conference review of grades, behavior plan	avms	
Julie Mejia	10/30/2014	0.45	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness club anti bullying project	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice	classroom	Alice Vail	
Julie Mejia	11/3/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice	student conference	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	11/4/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	teacher and student	Alice Vail Middle school	
Julie Mejia	11/4/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 students parents contacted	Alice Vail middle school	
Julie Mejia	11/21/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Falcon buck store	Vail	
Julie Mejia	10/27/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Practice	revised behavior plan,	AVMS	
Julie mejia	10/27/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Conference	meeting with students	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	10/28/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	student and teacher	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	10/28/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness club meeting	avms	
Julie Mejia	10/31/2014	0.15	B/D - PBIS Recognition	falcon buck store	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		AVMS	
Julie mejia	11/3/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness club anti bullying. perfect attendance awards	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	student conference bully situation	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	11/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	perfect attendance awards	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	11/12/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		AVMS	
Julie Mejia	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness Club, Falcon Buck Store	Alice Vail Middle School	
Julie Mejia	11/13/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice	students	Alice Vail Middle school	
Julie Mejia	11/13/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Conference	student and teacher	AVMS	
Julie Mejia	11/21/2014	0.45	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	parent teacher conference.	Vail MS	
Julie Mejia	11/19/2014	0.45	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Vail Middle School	
Julie Mejia	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	gossip with 4 girls	Vail	
Julie Mejia	11/20/2014	0.45	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness Club, daily kindness reports and slips.	Vail M. S.	
Julie Mejia	10/17/2014	0.45	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Alice Vail	
Julie Mejia	11/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PD review for ATI, and MTSS	Alice Vail Middle School	
Julie Mejia	11/12/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	approximately 5 situations	Alice Vail Middle School	
Julie Mejia	12/8/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	club meeting , helping students	Alice Vail Middle School	
Julie Mejia	12/11/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference	3 conferences documentaion	Alice Vail Middle School	
Julie Mejia	10/20/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	meeting with kindness club	Vail	
Julie Mejia	12/16/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Discipline students, restorative conferences, 3 different situation	Alice Vail Middle School	
JulieMejia	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	3 students / sped	AVMS	
Juliet Mejia	11/4/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness reports	Alice Vail Middle school	
Juliet mejia	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	4 students were disrupting study confernce assigned apology letter	Vail Middle School	
Juliet Mejia	11/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	falcon buck store	Alice Vail Middle School	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Justin Freitag	10/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/30/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/28/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/24/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	10/27/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/4/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/11/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	11/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford K-8	
Justin Freitag	12/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Safford	
Justin Freitag	12/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Safford	
Karen Paquette	10/27/2014	7	B/D - PBIS Recognition	certificate prep; PPT prep; reinforcers onto certs	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/27/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	determine perfect attendance: 0 tardy, <3 tardy	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle	+ 5th Gr re soccer problems	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/28/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Attendance checks 0 or <3 tardies	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/28/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	certificate and assembly prep	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	monitor, attempt Restorative Practice; student unreceptive	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Primary Student Recognition Assembly	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Intermediate Student Recognition Assembly	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/29/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Photos of recognition recipients for school posters	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Monitor student & attempt restorative practice with ; student unable to engage	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meet w/ & re bullying/pushing	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/29/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	inappropriate language & bus behavior	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	10/29/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Prep student recognition posters	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Walk with & monitor waiting for mother to pick up for Day 3 suspension	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	conference w/ & about throwing rocks on the playground	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/4/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	de-escalation & plan of action w/	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/5/2014	75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Accompany to his Kinder classroom; monitor; accompany into classroom	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Diffuse student interaction; assist call to Mom; Mom asks for bullying investigation	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/5/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	interview re bullying report from	Hudlow	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Karen Paquette	11/5/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Accompany [redacted] to lunch; reinforce he meets with [redacted] after eating	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	5th Grade	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	de-escalation & monitor [redacted]	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	[redacted], call Mom again, develop plan of action for return to classroom	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Perras' 3rd Gr class	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Barnes' 3rd Gr class	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle	Bus situation with [redacted]	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Monitor [redacted], de-escalation, plan to return to classroom	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/7/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	call from [redacted] concerning student lunch for Monday 11/10	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Re-organize student photo recognition bulletin board	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Bulletin Board - remove old, prepare new materials & post	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Prep list of referred students; deliver notice to teachers for students spending lunch in Restorative practice	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/12/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PBIS 3 data PD + travel	Bloom / Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	pbis.org research for Team Implementation Checklist; share info with fellow LSCs	Bloom / Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	[redacted] hands to self classwide lesson	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	4: Mindful Seeing classwide lesson	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	10/21/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Monitor [redacted] RP accountability for own actions; meet with mother; facilitate mother's request for meeting w/Providence, [redacted]	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Draft/prep discipline referral, classroom incident report, discipline procedures, intermediate & primary think-time sheets	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	[redacted]: Mindful Seeing	Hudlow	
Karen Paquette	10/22/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Prep, organization, communicate to staff	Bloom	
Karen Paquette	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Assist/monitor [redacted] in recovery & return to classroom	Bloom	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Classroom Visit	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met w/teacher to plan Restorative Circle w/class	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	New Student Orientation	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Organizing Restorative Conference Teacher/Student	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	New Student Conference	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative Conference Preparation	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met w/new students to discuss GSRR and PBIS	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Facilitated Restoratives Conferences	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/12/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Attended PBIS Data Analysis Training at District Office	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Went to TUSD Print Shop for PBIS Matrix Posters	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Distributed PBIS Materials to Faculty	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Facilitated RC between two students	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Facilitated RC between two students	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Facilitated Restorative Conference between students	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle	Facilitated Restorative Circle, Drafted Agreement	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/14/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Posting PBIS Matrices	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Interviewing SS for Restorative Conference	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	11/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Facilitated Restorative Conference w/SS students	Rincon	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kathryn Gunnels	10/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Faculty/Student Bulletin PBIS Support & Recognition	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	12/3/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Facilitated Restorative Conferences/Interpreter Services	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	12/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met to discuss conflict w/other	Rincon	
Kathryn Gunnels	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Visited classroom as follow up to Restorative Circle	Rincon	
Kathy Chandler	10/24/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/30/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/31/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kathy Chandler	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/5/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/5/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/7/2014	0.76	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/10/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/10/2014	1.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/10/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/10/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/12/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/12/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/12/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/13/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/14/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/14/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/17/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kathy Chandler	11/17/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/18/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/19/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/19/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/20/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/20/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/20/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/20/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/21/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/24/2014	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/23/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	1/5/2015	7	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/25/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cavett	
Kathy Chandler	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cavett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/27/2014	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/27/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/4/2014	1.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/7/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/7/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/14/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	11/26/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/20/2014	0.66	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Booth-Fickett	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kellin Lovegren	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	12/17/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kellin Lovegren	12/19/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Booth-Fickett	
Kievit, Reem	12/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/8/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/8/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	House Meeting	Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/14/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/15/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/16/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/22/2015	2.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/27/2015	0.25	Select a Function	behavior plan	Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/29/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	1/30/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Teacher
Kievit, Reem	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/16/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/17/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/18/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/19/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Steele	Teacher
Kievit, Reem	3/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kievit, Reem	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/12/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/26/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/1/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/2/2015	2.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/2/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/9/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/13/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/22/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Teacher
Kievit, Reem	4/23/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/24/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/27/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/29/2015	3.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/4/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/5/2015	2.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kievit, Reem	5/5/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/6/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/12/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/13/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/14/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/15/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/18/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/19/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/20/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kievit, Reem	5/21/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	Student
Kim McNally	12/8/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/8/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/27/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/29/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/30/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/31/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/5/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/7/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/10/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/13/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kim McNally	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/14/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/22/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/20/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/21/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/23/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/24/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/19/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/21/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/24/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/22/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/25/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/26/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/5/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/1/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student and parent meeting	Wheeler	
Kim McNally	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/21/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	1/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	1/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	1/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	1/5/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	
Kim McNally	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	

Name	Date Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
King, Josephine	1/7/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/7/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Teacher
King, Josephine	1/8/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/12/2015	7 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/9/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/12/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	Teacher
King, Josephine	1/13/2015	3 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/14/2015	2 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/15/2015	4 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/15/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/16/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/20/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/21/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/22/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/23/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/26/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/26/2015	4 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/27/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/28/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/29/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/29/2015	3 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/30/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	1/30/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/2/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/3/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/3/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Practice		Select Your School	Student
King, Josephine	2/4/2015	6 Select a Function		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/5/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/6/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/9/2015	8 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/10/2015	2 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/11/2015	6 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/12/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Consequence		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/13/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/16/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	10/29/2014	2 B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
King, Josephine	2/17/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Practice		Select Your School	Student
King, Josephine	2/18/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Circle		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/18/2015	3 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/20/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	2/25/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/9/2015	6 B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	10/30/2014	3 B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
King, Josephine	3/2/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Teacher
King, Josephine	3/3/2015	8 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/4/2015	5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
King, Josephine	3/5/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/10/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/12/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/13/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/11/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/12/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/23/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/24/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/24/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/25/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/26/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/27/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/30/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	3/31/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/1/2015	7	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/2/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/6/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/7/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/8/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/27/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/29/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	4/30/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/1/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/4/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/5/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/6/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/7/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/8/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/11/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/12/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/13/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/14/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/15/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/19/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/20/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	5/21/2015	8	Select a Function		Doolen	Student
King, Josephine	11/12/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
King, Josephine	11/19/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
King, Josephine	11/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
King, Josephine	12/5/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
King, Josephine	1/6/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Doolen	
King, Josephine	1/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Doolen	
Kira	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Two boys fighting in class, sent to cool down and discuss issue.	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira	11/14/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Cafecito	Ochoa	
Kira	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Time Reflection	Ochoa	
Kira	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Circle with class, corrales	Ochoa	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kira	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Two 5th graders using foul language at lunch	Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two 4th graders being mean to each other in class	Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	3rd grader pinched another student in class, sent out of class to finish work and discuss what happened and how to fix.	Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Friendship Group, building relationships, positive talk, self-esteem	Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch time Reflection	Ochoa	
Kira	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Lunch Reflection: students reflect on their negative behaviors in class and make a plan for improvement, apology letters, face to face discussions	Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle	Problem solving at Lunch Reflection	Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Students misbehaving, unfocused, argumentative with teacher;	Ochoa	
Kira	10/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Working with group of student to promote positive behaviors	Ochoa	
Kira	10/27/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	working with small group to promote positive behaviors	Ochoa	
Kira	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	working with small group to promote positive behaviors	Ochoa	
Kira	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	working with small group to promote positive behaviors	Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	working with small group to promote positive behaviors	Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Working with small group to promote positive behaviors	Ochoa	
Kira	10/28/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	
Kira	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	positive rewards discussion, survey to parents and staff	Ochoa	
Kira	10/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	
Kira	10/20/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Ochoa	
Kira	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Problem-solving	Ochoa	
Kira	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	
Kira	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Ochoa	
Kira	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Problem Solving	Ochoa	
Kira	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ochoa	
Kira	11/10/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Ochoa	
Kira	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	
Kira	11/17/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ochoa	
Kira	11/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	
Kira	12/1/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Ochoa	
Kira	12/1/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	problem solving	Ochoa	
Kira	12/8/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch detention	Ochoa	
Kira	10/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Ochoa	
Kira	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	boys playing frisbee hit two children in play area	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	shared information with student teacher to assist in problem solving in classroom	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two girls suppose to present MIXIFY at Assembly - misunderstanding, work through	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Entering Minutes into MTSS Agenda form and uploading	Ochoa Community Magnet School	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/27/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Reflection	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/28/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Reflection	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Working with small group to solve communication problems - Lunchtime Reflection, small group focus, individuals completing behavior reflections individually, then discussing happening and problem-solving to repair relationships and/or situation.	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	10/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	La Frontera connectio, fax, calls	Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Kira Moore-Rendon	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ochoa Community Magnet School	
Knippen, Dustin	1/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/13/2015	0.5	Select a Function	Monitoring Before School	Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/14/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.5	Select a Function	Monitoring Before School	Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/21/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/26/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/26/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Knippen, Dustin	1/26/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/29/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	2/3/2015	0.25	Select a Function	Class Coverage	Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Knippen, Dustin	2/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/10/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/10/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/10/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	2/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/20/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/25/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	2/25/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	3/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/25/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Knippen, Dustin	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	3/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	3/31/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/1/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/1/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/2/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	4/2/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	4/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/8/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/23/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/14/2015	9	Select a Function		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	4/24/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	4/29/2015	8	Select a Function	Sick Time	Secrist	Teacher
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Parent
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/13/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/13/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/14/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Select Your School	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/19/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Secrist	Student
Knippen, Dustin	5/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Secrist	Student
KPaq	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Candle/Jar group problem solving & personal space	Hudlow	
KPaq	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	: Candle/Jar group problem solving & personal space	Hudlow	
KPaq	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalation, develop plan for the day	Hudlow	
KPaq	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	meet w re for Restorative Practice	Bloom	
KPaq	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Confer w/Social Worker re Rest Practice	Bloom	
KPaq	11/19/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Behavior choices discussion with	Bloom	
KPaq	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	RP w monitor work completion	Bloom	
KPaq	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Monitor/conference w/	Bloom	

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
KPaq	12/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice): make a plan to deal with frustration & to take responsibility for own actions	Hudlow	
KPaq	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Primary	Bloom	
KPaq	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Intermediate	Bloom	
KPaq	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Monthly Administrator meeting, discipline, attendance, MTSS, PBIS	Hudlow	
KPaq	12/9/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	check-in/check-out (5)	Bloom	
KPaq	12/9/2014	2.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Monitor & restorative conversation (K), 11:30-1:55	Bloom	
				Interview student about event before school (
KPaq	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hudlow	
KPaq	1/5/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Check in w/ & good choices in behavior	Bloom	
Lacey Grijala	1/6/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle	Two 8th graders	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/20/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	Two students in 8th grade	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	Student was claiming that he was being bullied by other student	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	Student yelled in other students face.	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/22/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Grabber store before school	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Student sent out of class for humming	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	school assembly	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	teacher requested	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/20/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	Two kinder student	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/20/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student stayed rest of day with me. Did work in office	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/27/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	two first graders fighting in class.	Hollinger	
				Student out of class due to behavior, stayed with me until mom was able to bring meds		
Lacey Grijalva	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/28/2014	0.15	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student earned time out of class with me	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/28/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	7th grader complaint from teacher	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/29/2014	0.4	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	work on teacher of the month stuff	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/30/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	2nd grade students	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/29/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	grabber store before school	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/29/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	grabber store after school	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/30/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	fifth grade students check in	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	3rd grade students out of class due to behavior	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle	Two kinders	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/31/2014	0.15	B/D - Restorative Conference	Teacher requested on with student	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/31/2014	0.15	B/D - Restorative Conference	6th grader	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	10/31/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	met with three first graders about getting bullied	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	11/3/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	worked on teacher of the month stuff	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	11/3/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	Student sent out of class, worked with student on think time sheet	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	1/6/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle	6th and 8th grade boys	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	1/6/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle	6th grade boy and 8th grade girl	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	1/6/2015	0.15	B/D - Restorative Conference	went into 8th grade class with Mrs. Porter to do a quick class	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	1/6/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	students had a misunderstanding after school	Hollinger	
Lacey Grijalva	1/7/2015	0.15	B/D - PBIS Recognition	worked on teacher of the month	Hollinger	
Liz Hoover	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/7/2014	15	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	mural contact for student council am meeting	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/10/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Puppet club prep for PBIS performance	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/10/2014	30	B/D - PBIS Recognition	check in folders	Mission View	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Liz Hoover	11/12/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/12/2014	0.15	B/D - PBIS Recognition	check in folders	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/12/2014	0.15	B/D - PBIS Recognition	check in folders	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/17/2014	30	B/D - PBIS Recognition	check in folders	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/17/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Doz Manos Puppetry PBIS prep with 32 students	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/19/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/24/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Check in folders	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/25/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	daily check in folders 10 students	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	11/26/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Check in folders	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	showcase Opera character messages	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/1/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Doz Manos Puppet Club 35 students practice	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	meeting with 8 students re: gender bullying	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/8/2014	0.3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Check in folders 12 students	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/9/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Noche de Gala student prep-school wide	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/9/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Noche de Gala student support	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	meet with students re : gender bullying	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	meeting to follow up gender bullying	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	LSC and principal interview of 6 students re in class issues	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/12/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/12/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/15/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	prep for PBIS performance	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/16/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	assembly	Mission View	
Liz Hoover	12/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mission View	
Lopez, Dale	1/8/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/8/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/15/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/15/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/16/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/16/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lopez, Dale	1/20/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Other (Please
Lopez, Dale	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/22/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/22/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/23/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/26/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/26/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/28/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/29/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/3/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/3/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/3/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/4/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lopez, Dale	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/17/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/19/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/19/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/24/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/24/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	2/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Other (Please
Lopez, Dale	3/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/12/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Other (Please
Lopez, Dale	3/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Purple/Turquoise Game	Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lopez, Dale	3/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/27/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/29/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/30/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/31/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	3/31/2015	4.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/1/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/2/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Other (Please
Lopez, Dale	4/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/4/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/7/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/22/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/30/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lopez, Dale	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/4/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/5/2015	4.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/8/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Other (Please
Lopez, Dale	5/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/11/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/12/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/15/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/18/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/19/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/19/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/19/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/20/2015	4.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roskruge	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lopez, Dale	5/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Roskruge	Student
Lopez, Dale	5/21/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Roskruge	Student
Lorraine H Richards	11/24/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	1/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Lorraine H Richards	1/8/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	Teacher
Lorraine H Richards	9/25/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	9/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	9/29/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	9/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	9/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/2/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/13/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/14/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/14/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/16/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/16/2014	2.15	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/17/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/20/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/20/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/21/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/23/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/24/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/27/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/28/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/3/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/4/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/6/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/7/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual student conferences	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Time out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/10/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/12/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Time out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/14/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lorraine H Richards	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/17/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/18/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/20/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual Conferences	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/21/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual Student Conferences	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	11/25/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/1/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual Student Conferences	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/1/2014	2.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/2/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/3/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual Conferences	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/5/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student Conferences	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/8/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/8/2014	5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	ISS	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/9/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/9/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detention	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/9/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/11/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/12/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/16/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	
Lorraine H Richards	12/8/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out/Lunch Detention	Dietz	
Lovegren, Kellin	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Teacher
Lovegren, Kellin	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Teacher
Lovegren, Kellin	1/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Other (Please
Lovegren, Kellin	1/8/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Teacher
Lovegren, Kellin	1/8/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fickett	Teacher
Lovegren, Kellin	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lovegren, Kellin	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/16/2015	3.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/27/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	1/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/2/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/3/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/5/2015	0.5	Select a Function		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/5/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	4/22/2015	1.5	Select a Function	Professional Development	Fickett	Teacher
Lovegren, Kellin	4/28/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	4/28/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/1/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/6/2015	2.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/6/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/8/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/11/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/12/2015	2.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Teacher

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Lovegren, Kellin	5/12/2015	1.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/14/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/15/2015	3.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Fickett	Student
Lovegren, Kellin	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Fickett	Student
Lower, Beau	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/20/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/22/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Other (Please
Lower, Beau	2/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/13/2015	7	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/16/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/17/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/18/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/20/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	3/2/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	3/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/16/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/23/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/26/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/27/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/28/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/29/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	1/30/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lower, Beau	2/2/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Practice		Palo Verde	Student
Lydia Rollins	12/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	
Lydia Rollins	12/18/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gridley	
Lydia Rollins	12/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	
Masi, Gail	1/9/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/16/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/6/2015	1.15	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Masi, Gail	1/7/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/21/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/11/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/13/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/6/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/20/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/10/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/10/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miller	Parent
Masi, Gail	1/5/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/26/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	District Training	Miller	Teacher
Masi, Gail	1/26/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/2/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/13/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/8/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/15/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/5/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/9/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	2/23/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/3/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/5/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/6/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/9/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/10/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/11/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/12/2015	1.25	Select a Function		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/24/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/24/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/25/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	March Team Meeting	Miller	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Masi, Gail	3/26/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/26/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Monthly Team Meeting PBIS	Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/31/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/1/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/1/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Miller Merit Store	Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/2/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/2/2015	0	Select a Function	No School	Miller	Other (Please
Masi, Gail	4/6/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/8/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/9/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/10/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/13/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/15/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/16/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/17/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	3/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/20/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	12/19/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/21/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/22/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/22/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/24/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/27/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/28/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/29/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/29/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/1/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/5/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/6/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/7/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/8/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Administer student survey on bullying	Miller	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Masi, Gail	5/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/13/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/11/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/14/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/15/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/18/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/19/2015	0.25	Select a Function	Time Entry	Miller	Other (Please
Masi, Gail	5/20/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/20/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	May Team Meeting	Miller	Teacher
Masi, Gail	5/21/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Miller	Student
Masi, Gail	5/22/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miller	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/20/2015	3	Select a Function		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/20/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/4/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/5/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Maxwell, Cindy	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	2/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/2/2015	1	Select a Function	Counseling	Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/2/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/11/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	3/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/6/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/21/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/22/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/27/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/30/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/27/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	4/29/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/4/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/5/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/5/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/7/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/8/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/11/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/12/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Miles	Student
Maxwell, Cindy	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Maxwell, Cindy	5/18/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	student issues	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/12/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	student support	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/15/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	Parent
McNally, Kimberly	12/16/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	plan for circles in January	Select Your School	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Behavior support	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/18/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Wheeler	Teacher
McNally, Kimberly	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Select Your School	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/4/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/3/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/31/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/6/2015	2	Select a Function	LSC data entry	Wheeler	Other (Please
McNally, Kimberly	4/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Parent
McNally, Kimberly	4/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/13/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/17/2015	8	Select a Function		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/27/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/28/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
McNally, Kimberly	4/29/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Warren	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/29/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	10/28/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	10/28/2014	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Parent
McNally, Kimberly	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/2/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/2/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/2/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Parent
McNally, Kimberly	5/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Wheeler	Parent
McNally, Kimberly	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/17/2014	1	Select a Function		Wheeler	Teacher
McNally, Kimberly	12/18/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/18/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	12/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/13/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/13/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/14/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/15/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Teacher
McNally, Kimberly	1/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/16/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/20/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/26/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/27/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/29/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
McNally, Kimberly	1/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
McNally, Kimberly	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/2/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/13/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/12/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/11/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/7/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/5/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/14/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Warren	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/14/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/15/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/15/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/30/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/30/2015	0.5	Select a Function		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Wheeler	Parent
McNally, Kimberly	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/22/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/24/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/9/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/7/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	4/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/18/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/19/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	5/20/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wheeler	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
McNally, Kimberly	3/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/11/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/12/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/23/2015	1.5	Select a Function		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
McNally, Kimberly	2/4/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
Mejia, Julie	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	worked with group of students	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	1/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	students	Select Your School	Student
Mejia, Julie	1/28/2015	1	Select a Function	Performed MTSS Professional training for teachers, and staff	Select Your School	Teacher
Mejia, Julie	2/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	kindness club, activities, falcon buck store and drawing	Select Your School	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/5/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference	4 diferent situations, investigation involving bullying	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/6/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	addressed several situations regarding diruption in class, and bullying	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	arranging positive reinforcments for students poor scores to assist motivating to attend study confernce.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	worked on kindness bulliten board, drawing for kindness, and motivational recognition.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/9/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference	discussed strategies to not disrupt when feeling impulsive to talk.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	working with students concerning a possible bully incident, investigation	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	meeting for perfect attendance reognition	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/10/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference	investigation. 3 restorative conferences, and responses to reported bullying	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/20/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	kindness and student recognition	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/18/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	meeting , behavior plans for several students.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/18/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	conferenced with teacher and students.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	3 students.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	meeting	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	2/16/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Consequence	escorting and rounding up kids for study conference, assigning kids who have Fs contacting parents.	Vail	Other (Please
Mejia, Julie	2/23/2015	1.3	B/D - Restorative Practice	met with students concerning disruption, lack of respect	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	met with 2 students concerning behavior and grades	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	fundraiser, reward for students.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	reward for students	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	3 conferences with students and teachers.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/5/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference	several students. investigation concerning bullying	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	investigation of bullying, and or potential fight	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/23/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	3/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	met with student concerning bullying, restorative conference, contacted parent.	Vail	Student

Name	Date Work P.	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Mejia, Julie	4/14/2015	0	Select a Function	out/ sick	Select Your School	Other (Please
Mejia, Julie	4/13/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	EEF for student supplies, back packs shoes.	Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	4/24/2015	30	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	4/27/2015	30	B/D - Restorative Circle		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Select Your School	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/12/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/12/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vail	Student
Mejia, Julie	5/13/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vail	Student
Mercedes Vella	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis Bilingual	
Mercedes Vella	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis Bilingual	
Mercedes Vella	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/28/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Called parent and logged student behavior in Mojave Interventions.	Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Spoke to principal and counselor about 2 incidents for Oct 28	Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	Input data in Mojave Interventions for 2 students who had a Restorative Circle.	Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/29/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	10/30/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	10/31/2014	5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	11/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	11/6/2014	2.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/7/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Met with parent volunteer to go over PBIS.	Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/14/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	.Met with a parent volunteer who helps with PBIS	Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/14/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	
Mercedes Vella	11/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	11/25/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	
Mercedes Vella	10/23/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Davis Bilingual Magnet School	
Mercedes Vella	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Davis Bilingual	
Mercedes Vella	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Davis Bilingual	
Mercedes Vella	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Davis Bilingual	
Mia Michelle Henry	10/22/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	disruptive student	Wright	
Mia Michelle Henry	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Wright	
Mia Michelle Henry	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	
Mia Michelle Henry	10/27/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Blenman	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Mia Michelle Henry	11/13/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	
Mia Michelle Henry	11/13/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	
MiaMichelle	11/25/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	RB	Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	10/27/2014	0.15	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	4th lunch reward (5 students)	Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	10/30/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	5 different kids	Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Attendance reward	Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/7/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	with parent	Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	12/2/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Wright	
MiaMichelle Henry	12/9/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	1/5/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	review training k-2	Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	1/6/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	review training 4-5	Blenman	
MiaMichelle Henry	1/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Blenman	
Milligan, Jan	1/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Parent
Milligan, Jan	1/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/13/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Select Your School	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Parent
Milligan, Jan	1/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Milligan, Jan	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/26/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/26/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	1/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	1/30/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	1/30/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Parent
Milligan, Jan	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/3/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/3/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/4/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/5/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/6/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/16/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/18/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/18/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Parent
Milligan, Jan	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/19/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	2/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/23/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Parent
Milligan, Jan	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	2/25/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Milligan, Jan	3/25/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	3/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Other (Please
Milligan, Jan	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Sewell	Parent
Milligan, Jan	4/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/28/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/29/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/29/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/30/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	5/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/4/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/7/2015	5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sewell	Teacher
Milligan, Jan	5/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sewell	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Milligan, Jan	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sewell	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Cragin	Student
Milligan, Jan	5/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Cragin	Teacher
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/20/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	converse, work and restore students w/ problematic behavior choices	Select Your School	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/5/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	working with children, discussing what happened and repairing relationships	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Kinder, Ms. E's class	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Room 5 1st Grade	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/6/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	working with students to focus on productive behaviors, positive reinforcement, vs. negative attention	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	working with students to discuss what hapened and repair relationships	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/13/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	2/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	parent input	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/12/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	504 Reviews	Ochoa	Other (Please
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	restoring relationships, brainstorming startegies, accountability	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Catch someone being kind	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/8/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	New forms for 504, check status, prep for reveiws	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/6/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/5/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Ochoa	Teacher
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	5/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/9/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/10/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/11/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	Other (Please
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/24/2015	1.5	Select a Function	Site Council	Ochoa	Other (Please
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/26/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	class	Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/30/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kir	3/31/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	3/31/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/1/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/2/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/6/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/7/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/8/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/9/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/10/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/13/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/20/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/21/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/22/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/24/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/28/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/29/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/29/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/29/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/30/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ochoa	Student
Moore-Rendon, Kirra	4/30/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ochoa	Student
Murphy, Denise	1/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	observation	Bormon	Student
Murphy, Denise	1/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Soleng Tom	Student
Murphy, Denise	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	1/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	The Science of Kindness-assembly by Ben's Bells Founder	Soleng Tom	Student
Murphy, Denise	1/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Reviewing School Plan	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Watched and reviewed RP slide Show on LSC site	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	1/30/2015	1.5	Select a Function	MTSS - Organization and Logistics	Bormon	Teacher
Murphy, Denise	2/2/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PBIS - Prep for GSRR Presentation to Parents	Soleng Tom	Parent
Murphy, Denise	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	GSRR	Bormon	Parent

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Murphy, Denise	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	w/ administrator and Counselor	Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	2/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	schoolwide flag ceremony and kindness recognitions	Bormon	Student
Murphy, Denise	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Final practice of GSRR Parent Presentation	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	2/10/2015	0.5	Select a Function	MTSS Team Documentation	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	2/11/2015	0.5	Select a Function	MTSS - Committee Documentation	Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Soleng Tom	Student
Murphy, Denise	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/13/2015	3.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/23/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Quarterly Incident Report Documentation and Reporting	Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/23/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Quarterly Incident Report Documentation and Reporting	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	w/ Counselor	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Strive for Excellence Assembly	Soleng Tom	Parent
Murphy, Denise	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	standards, matrix, referral	Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	4/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	for MTSS Mtg	Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	4/22/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Soleng Tom	Teacher
Murphy, Denise	4/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	4/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bormon	Student
Murphy, Denise	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bormon	Student
Murphy, Denise	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bormon	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	5/1/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Flag Ceremony	Bormon	Student
Murphy, Denise	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bormon	Student
Murphy, Denise	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Strive for excellence assemblies	Soleng Tom	Student
Murphy, Denise	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Strive for Excellence Assembly	Soleng Tom	Student
Murphy, Denise	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Soleng Tom	Other (Please
Murphy, Denise	5/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Awards assemblies	Bormon	Student
Nicol, Ruth	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Nicol, Ruth	2/3/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Teacher
Nicol, Ruth	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Teacher
Nicol, Ruth	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins	Teacher
Nicol, Ruth	2/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/9/2015	2.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/10/2015	3.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/11/2015	3.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/13/2015	1.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/2/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/9/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins	Teacher
Nicol, Ruth	3/9/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/10/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/11/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/12/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/27/2015	2.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/4/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/5/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Robins	Student
Nicol, Ruth	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins	Student
Nina Hickman	10/24/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	

Name	Date Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Nina Hickman	10/24/2014	2 B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	10/28/2014	1 B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	10/28/2014	3 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Walking Club	Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	10/20/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	10/20/2014	1 B/D - Restorative Circle		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	10/29/2014	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	10/29/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/3/2014	2 B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	11/4/2014	3 B/D - Restorative Conference		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/4/2014	3 B/D - PBIS Recognition	Visiting Classes to give out Walking Club Awards	Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	10/17/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/7/2014	3 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/6/2014	2 B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	11/6/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	11/7/2014	2 B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/13/2013	4 B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/11/2014	4 B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/13/2014	4 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/14/2014	4 B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/14/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	11/17/2014	1 B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	10/13/2014	1 B/D - Restorative Circle		Carrillo	
Nina Hickman	10/22/2014	1 B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	10/22/2014	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Pueblo Gardens	
Nina Hickman	12/5/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Carrillo	
Ojeda, Pat	12/8/2014	0.5 B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Conference with 4th gr. teacher-behavioral plan for student (letter to parent-translated)	Lynn-Urquides	Parent
Ojeda, Pat	12/11/2014	0.5 B/D - PBIS Recognition	Mtg. with Comm. Rep. to recognize students for TUSD event	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	12/12/2014	2 B/D - PBIS Recognition	6 students recognized, participated in TUSD/EEF Annual Shoe Party Event	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	12/16/2014	0.5 B/D - PBIS Recognition	Coordinated with Manzo Comm. Rep. & Principal for student event on 12/17/	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	12/17/2014	4 B/D - PBIS Recognition	TUSD annual holiday event for students with TPD, & PCSD, & Admin.	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	12/18/2014	4 B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student Recognition annual holiday event with TPD, PCSD, & Admin.	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/8/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Practice	New student-refusing to go to class (conference with teacher)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/8/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with students- referred after Bullying incident in class (4th gr. girls)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/8/2015	0.25 B/D - Restorative Consequence	Conference with teacher re: Bullying incident with girls	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/8/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Practice	Met with Counselor & students for problem-solving (incident on playground)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/9/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with new student @ Manzo	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/9/2015	0.5 B/D - PBIS Recognition	In cafeteria with students & staff-recognizing positive student examples	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/13/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student has in-house suspension with buddy teacher (Mizban)	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/13/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Consequence	Conference with Counselor-student has 3 day in-house suspension for behavior	Lynn-Urquides	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Ojeda, Pat	1/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Follow-up with teacher-student on 3 day in-house suspension	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference with Principal-students took money from teacher	Manzo	Teacher
Ojeda, Pat	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Principal & I met with the 4 students involved in money incident	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Teacher met with Principal & LSC re: consequence for students. Parents called	Manzo	Teacher
Ojeda, Pat	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Follow-up with students involved in taking money from teacher	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met the rest of the students (2nd group) involved in money incident	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	In classrooms with students-recognizing PBIS behavior (2nd gr.)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Crisis-Student tore up matric card, threw keyboard, throwing items in lab	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with student who had crisis yesterday	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conference with Counselor-student behavioral intervention plan	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with new student from Bloom	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with teacher & student who had 3 day in-house last week	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Met with 2 boys who were involved in a physical altercation (in-house suspension per Principal)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference with Principal-intervention groups in classroom	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Follow-up with students involved in incident	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student behavioral plan follow-up after he tore papers & destroyed school property	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student recognized for basketball team by teacher	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Student could not attend field trip (mom forgot to sign permission slip)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference with teacher could not attend field trip)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Conference with Counselor to plan guidance lesson for Kinders	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with teacher & student who did not attend field trip yesterday	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	1/30/2015	1.5	Select a Function	LSC Documentation	Manzo	Other (Please
Ojeda, Pat	2/2/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Teacher referred student after he was being defiant in class	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student left classroom without permission, parent called	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Teacher Conference	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with students who were referred to Counselor for behavioral plan	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Follow-up with students to recognize them for participation & cooperation with sub	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student referred by teacher-he bit another student during lunch)	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Teacher referral-'student ripping homework & papers in class'. Student removed from class	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Parent called to come to school per front office (student who tore homework)-	Manzo	Parent
Ojeda, Pat	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	In classroom-student recognition	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Recognizing students for work completed on project (Greek Mythology)	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with student who's having difficulty in class-Conference with teacher	Manzo	Student

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Ojeda, Pat	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meeting with student who had difficulty staying in classroom (teacher Conference)	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	3/10/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Shyanne Kindness Project Recognition Program for students	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	3/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student Recognition Award Assembly	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	3/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	mojave entries	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	3/13/2015	0.75	Select a Function	Meeting with Administrator-debrief on ATI exams	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	3/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Attended Lynn softball game after school to support students	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	3/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	4/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student Assembly/Student Recognition	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Schoolwide Assembly for blessing of Student Mural with Members of governing board & community	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference held with 2 students	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student Assembly	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/19/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student Sports Assembly-Award Presentation	Lynn-Urquides	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Awards Assembly with students	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/21/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	5th grade Promotion	Manzo	Student
Ojeda, Pat	5/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Kinder Promotion	Manzo	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/9/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/20/2015	0.45	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	1/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Parent
Ottley, Ruth	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/10/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Ottley, Ruth	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	2/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	3/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	3/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/26/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/26/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	3/31/2015	0.15	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/7/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/10/2015	0.5	Select a Function	emails	Grijalva	Teacher
Ottley, Ruth	4/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/17/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/28/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/28/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/29/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Ottley, Ruth	4/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	: Candle/Jar group problem solving & personal space	Hudlow	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Paquette, Karen	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	calming, de-escalation; email note to mom	Hudlow	Parent
Paquette, Karen	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	call grandmother; consult with	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	prep PBIS school posters & class attendance posters	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	teacher/principal signatures on Perfect Attendance & other recognition certificates	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Prepare items for student recognition assemblies	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalation prep for return to classroom	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conversation follow up Mother	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	refusal to attend/cooperate @ orchestra; returned to SC making "gun fingers" at classmates; assist with return to class	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	plan	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	RP w/	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	prep student presentation of Self-Directed Learner life skill for 1/26	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/19/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	prep certificates, reinforcers, student acknowledgement lists	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	order & pick up photographs of student recognition assemblies	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Prep & print student recognition posters for hall display	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/27/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	prepare PBIS classroom/learning area, hallway, restroom posters; Student Recognition posters	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	lamine PBIS posters & student recognition posters	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/28/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	complete Behavior Expectation posters for classrooms, hallways, restrooms	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalation & work completion with	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Generate more classroom behavior expectation posters (primary's change)	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	lunch discussion re respect/disrespect ()	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/2/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Prep primary behavior expectation posters	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/2/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalate, monitor phone calls to Mom & to Dad; develop Respect social story; draft apology letters; develop plan of action	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	: Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	tudent GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	de-escalation w ; call to group home)	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle	Attempted RC w/ Students uncooperative; re-attempt later.	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Student GSRR	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	RP with thinking before speaking/acting	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/16/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition	student recognition awards	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Escort from the classroom; prep plan for return to class	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Principal & LSC w	Bloom	Student

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Paquette, Karen	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	"meeting agreement" discussion w [redacted] prep plan for return to classroom	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/17/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Fighting in classroom: [redacted] consult w/principal	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/25/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	monitor [redacted] in hallway; attempt de-escalation	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	2/24/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	de-escalation w [redacted] call mother [redacted]; conf w/mother	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	RP w/ [redacted]; develop plan of action for day & for return to classroom	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	classroom (restroom accident) de-escalation; call Mom; prep for return to classroom	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	classroom	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meet w/ [redacted] de-escalation; prep plan for day & return to classroom	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalation w [redacted] prep for return to classroom	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	RP w/ [redacted] wrote "you will pay Ms. W" on Ms. Werner's floor	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	referral [redacted] Consent, emails, referral prep	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/31/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalation w/ [redacted] plan for return to class; direct teach effective student skills	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	504s: [redacted] & [redacted] RC w/phone calls to parents (vulgar language on playground)	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	playground)	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/2/2015	6.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Schoolwide "Express Yourself" day (green group)	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	[redacted] 504 plans	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	check in with [redacted]	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	check-in/morning break with [redacted]	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	check in/break w [redacted]	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	[redacted] to Dad [redacted]	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	[redacted] inappropriate language on playground	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	[redacted] recess disagreement	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Prep student recognition awards	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	1:1 time w/ [redacted]	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/20/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	prep student recognition awards; communicate w/teachers	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student recognition awards	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	K, 1, 2	Select Your School	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	3, 4, 5	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	primary	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	intermediate	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	primary	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	intermediate	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student award prep	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/22/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Review attendance; prep Perfect Attendance certificates	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	9/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	primary	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	9/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	intermediate	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/24/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	[redacted] classroom behavior	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/27/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	organize student awards; list; prep for assemblies	Bloom	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Paquette, Karen	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Primary assembly	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Intermediate assembly	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	prepare class posters for hallway recognition	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	inappropriate comments to	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	& Mother; LSC facilitate student-generated behavior contract	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	de-escalation, prep for return to class:	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	(lunch)	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	De-escalation w call to parents; plan return to classroom	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	prep Q3 student recognition photo posters.	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	post photo posters for student recognition	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Individual conferences:	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	meet w	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meet -sub concern	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meet w to plan restorative conversation with	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Meet w re inappropriate language; prep for return to classroom	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	With	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	observe 5th grade PE	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Assist with lunchtime meltdowns:	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	& (4th)	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	prep student recognition certificates (attendance)	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	release ; review documentation, files, etc.	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	student recognition certificate prep	Bloom	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	finalize enter, copy, file, etc.	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	check in w/Gawthorpe's class	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	peeing on playground; call to parents	Hudlow	Student
Paquette, Karen	5/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	rock wall peeing	Hudlow	Student
Pat Ojeda	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student sent out of class , asked to write positive solutions	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	10/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Cafeteria-PBIS with Kinder, 1st & 2nd grade	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	9/8/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	School-wide PBIS Training with students (K-2 indiv. classrooms)	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	9/9/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	School-wide PBIS Training with students (3rd-5th indiv. classrooms)	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	10/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Cafeteria-PBIS Expectations-3rd, 4th, & 5th gr. students	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Conference with Counselor-Restorative Consequences (4 Students)	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Per Principal request-students in cafeteria- K, 1st, & 2nd graders	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/3/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Jump for Heart Student Assembly-K-5th grade	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Per Principal request-stay with children in cafeteria-K & 1st graders	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Per Principal request-with students in cafeteria-2nd & 3rd graders	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student removed from class-threatening behavior	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/5/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	PBIS Cafeteria Expectations 3rd/4th/5th gr. students	Manzo	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Pat Ojeda	11/5/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PBIS Dismissal Expectations with Principal-Bus Bay, Day-Care Vans, Parent Contact	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch group-Students did not complete work in class, came in @ lunch	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference with 3 boys after 'altercation on playground. Conf. with Principal.	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference with teacher, Principal & parent-playground incident	Manzo	
Pat ojeda	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Referral from Principal-students fighting on playground	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Referral from teacher-students not following safety rules on playground	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	3rd gr. students performed play for 1st gr. classroom-PBIS recognition	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/10/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	PBIS School-wide Activity-Jump for Hearts Basketball game with students & Staff	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	2nd gr. Restorative group with students from Ms. Pinedo Valeria,	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference with students-rock was thrown & student glasses were broken	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met with parent of student who had glasses broken on playground (R.C.)	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	4th gr. team meeting-Student behavior expectations & plans	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/13/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student was being disrespectful to teacher (flipped teacher off)	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/13/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Planning with Comm. Rep. for student recognition progrm K-5 on 11/14/14	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference with 4th gr. girls (bullying issues)	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with student after classroom incident yesterday (disrespectful to teacher)	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/14/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	4th grade students recognized for competing in Math Tournament	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/14/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with student who had his glasses broken on playground	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Assisting teacher with set-up for student evening event	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	10/28/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Per Principal-asked to be with kids in cafeteria during student lunch time	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	10/28/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with 2 students for a Restorative Conference	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	10/29/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with students on lunch detention	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Conference with teacher-student behavioral plan in class	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Classroom support/cafeteria expectations-4th grade	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/18/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Students came in during their lunch for Restorative Consequence	Lynn	
Pat Ojeda	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with students in classroom	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/20/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Superintendent & other dignitaries recognizing Manzo as 1st school in Pima County to serve its products to its students	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Students serving as hosts to guests-Superintendent & Assist. Sup.	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Conference with teacher-student hosts being recognized	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Referral from Principal-Bullying on playground	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative Conference with students-Counselor present during Restorative	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference with Counselor -bit another student	Lynn	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Pat Ojeda	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Follow-up with 2nd grade student-difficulty staying in class	Manzo	
Pat Ojeda	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conference with Counselor-student attendance	Lynn	
Patricia Gerhard	1/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	Student
Patricia Gerhard	10/27/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/28/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/29/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/30/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/31/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/31/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/31/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Home Visit	Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/4/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/5/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/6/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/6/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/7/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence	With Mary Quinan	Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/7/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/7/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/12/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/13/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/22/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/20/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/21/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Patricia Gerhard	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	11/25/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	11/26/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/2/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/8/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/9/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/23/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/11/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/15/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/15/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham Elementary	
Patricia Gerhard	12/17/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Patricia Gerhard	12/18/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	12/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	10/24/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	1/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	1/5/2015	2.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Erickson	
Patricia Gerhard	1/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dunham	
Payne, Joshua	1/21/2015	5	Select a Function		Sahuaro	Teacher
Payne, Joshua	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sahuaro	Student
Payne, Joshua	1/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sahuaro	Teacher
Payne, Joshua	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sahuaro	Parent
Payne, Joshua	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sahuaro	Student
Payne, Joshua	4/30/2015	3	Select a Function	SSAC	Sahuaro	Student
Payne, Joshua	5/7/2015	1	Select a Function		Sahuaro	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	2/19/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Planning student asseby	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	3/4/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	Organizing and securing forms	Van Buskirk	Student
Payton, Juanita	3/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student calling another name	Hollady	Student
Payton, Juanita	3/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	planning with counselor	Hollady	Student
Payton, Juanita	3/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Conferences with students	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	3/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	With counselor	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conference with 4th grader	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	5th grade girls	Hollady	Teacher

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Payton, Juanita	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Personal lunch	Hollady	Other (Please
Payton, Juanita	4/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Meeting with Lunch Monitors	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	4/10/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Field trip	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	4/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Early AM Program	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	5th graders	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meeting with two disagreeing teachers	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/7/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Community Meeting	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Met with girls onFacebook issue	Van Buskirk	Student
Payton, Juanita	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	checked in on facebook and kinder student issues	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	4th boys regarding playground issue	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	2nd grade 2tudent dance	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Planning event for Haynes	Hollady	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/18/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Kinder student follow-up	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Kinder Promotion	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	4th graders	Van Buskirk	Teacher
Payton, Juanita	5/21/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Awards Assembly, covered Kinder class	Hollady	Teacher
PBIS Training	11/11/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	3rd phrase of PBIS training	THMS	
Phyllis Cowman	1/8/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Prep for new circles for two teachers and students	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/27/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Monitoring discipline data for magnet coordinator	Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Phyllis Cowman	
Phyllis Cowman	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/29/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/29/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/31/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/31/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	11/4/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/4/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/12/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	11/12/2014	6	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Coverage of ISS for 2 6th graders as I worked on other things as well (also answered questions and gave quiz)	Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/14/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/14/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/22/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	Researched and gave volunteer resources to teacher	Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/22/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Phyllis Cowman	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/24/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	10/22/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/25/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Review of MSAP program. reinforcement menu created	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Collaboration with team about student's behavior Fri.	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	10/23/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Scheduled meeting with 6th gr. teachers to develop behavior plan	Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Planning for restorative circles this week	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Setting up circles for two groups of students	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/4/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/5/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	3 incidents: conferences and parent calls	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/8/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/9/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/9/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	12/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dodge	
Phyllis Cowman	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Collaboration for meeting tomorrow	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	12/19/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	1/5/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	1/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	1/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Prep for routines, signs, info for students	Bonillas	
Phyllis Cowman	1/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Bonillas	
Reem Kievit	10/23/2014	2.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/23/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Assembly	Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/28/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/30/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/30/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/30/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/31/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/6/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/7/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/13/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Reem Kievit	11/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/20/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	11/24/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Reem Kievit	12/2/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	12/4/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	12/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Steele	
Reem Kievit	12/15/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Steele	
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/12/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Select Your School	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/13/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/16/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/21/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/22/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Time Out	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Lunch Detentiion	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/29/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/29/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	1/30/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/2/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/5/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/10/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Practice	1.0	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/12/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/12/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/24/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/2/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/5/2015	0.15	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/6/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/9/2015	4.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/12/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/23/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/24/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Consequence	1.0	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/25/2015	6	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Parent
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/31/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/2/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/7/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/8/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/9/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/10/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/14/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Parent
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/21/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/21/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/23/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/28/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/1/2015	0.15	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/1/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/1/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/4/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/5/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Conference	.50	Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/7/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/8/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/11/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/12/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/18/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/19/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Richardson, Dr. Lorr	5/21/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/12/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/12/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/13/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/14/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/20/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/20/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/27/2015	6	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/28/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	1/28/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/2/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/2/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/9/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/9/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/10/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/17/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/17/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/17/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/16/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/16/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	2/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/2/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/9/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Select Your School	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/9/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/23/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/25/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/30/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/30/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	3/31/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/6/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/20/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/21/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/27/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/22/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/22/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/27/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	4/28/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/4/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/5/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/11/2015	5	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/12/2015	6	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Rivera Pelton, Roxa	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/14/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Review PBIS Expectations to 5th & 4th Grade Classrooms.	White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/15/2015	1.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Reviewing PBIS Expectations with 2nd & 3rd Grade Students.	White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/16/2015	1.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Teaching PBIS Expectations to Kinder & 1st Grade Students.	White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/16/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Focused on Safety Expectation in the Playground	White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.5	Select a Function	Lunch	White	Other (Please
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/23/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/26/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative Practices Trianing at 1010	White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	1/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/9/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/25/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/25/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Parent
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		White	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/26/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student to Ms. Howelll; for in-house suspension	White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/27/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/6/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/7/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		White	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/18/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rodriguez-Quihuis,	5/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/14/2015	5.5	Select a Function	MTSS Training	Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rollins, Lydia	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/26/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Training	Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/26/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	1/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/9/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/19/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/17/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/18/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	2/25/2015	3.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	3/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	3/23/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	3/31/2015	4.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/1/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/2/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/22/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/23/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/23/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/23/2015	1.25	Select a Function	Coordinate Homework Help	Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/24/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/24/2015	3.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/28/2015	1.75	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/29/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/30/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	4/30/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/7/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/7/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/6/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/4/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/4/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/1/2015	5.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/13/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/14/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Magee	Student

Name	Date Work P.	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Rollins, Lydia	5/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Magee	Other (Please
Rollins, Lydia	5/19/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Magee	Student
Rollins, Lydia	5/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Romancho	11/12/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference		Henry	
Romancho	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Henry	
Romancho	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Henry	
Romancho	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	1st grade	Gale	
Romancho	11/25/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
Romancho	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
Romancho	12/1/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
Romancho	12/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Gale	
Romancho	12/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Gale	
Romancho	12/15/2014	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	
Romancho	12/16/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	x2	Gale	
Romancho	1/6/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	
Romancho	1/6/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	
Romancho, Debra	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Select Your School	Student
Romancho, Debra	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	New Student in class, issues	Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	1/27/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	1/29/2015	0.3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Gotcha Coupons	Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	2/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	4/24/2015	30	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	4/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/1/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/4/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/7/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Discipline Report	Henry	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/12/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Gale	Student
Romancho, Debra	5/13/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Henry	Student
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/27/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/27/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/28/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/20/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Ford Elementary	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/20/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/29/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/29/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/3/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/3/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/4/2014	7	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/21/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/21/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/21/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/10/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/10/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/10/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/11/2014	5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/11/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/11/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/12/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/17/2014	7	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/24/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/24/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/25/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/25/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	11/26/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/1/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/2/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/20/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/8/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/8/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/8/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/15/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/15/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/15/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/16/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	12/16/2014	1.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	1/5/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	1/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	1/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	1/6/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Ford Elementary	
Roxanna Rivera-Pel	10/27/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Circle		Ford Elementary	
Ruth Nicol	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/20/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins K8	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Ruth Nicol	11/20/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/13/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/12/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	training	Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/12/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/10/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/10/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/10/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/31/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	12/9/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robins K8	
Ruth Nicol	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robins K8	
Ruth Ottley	10/22/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	R. Carpenter's Class	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Mr. Carpenter's Class	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	10/29/2014	0.45	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	with counselor P. Padilla	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	10/30/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/4/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Meet with Paul Padia re: Check-In/Check-Out	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/6/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Check-In/Check-Out with Hatfield	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/6/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Check-In/Check-Out with Ms. Grijalva	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Teach & Model Classroom Routines - Ms. Bish	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Ms. Basinger	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Basinger	Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/19/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/26/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	11/26/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/1/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/3/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/4/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/10/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/12/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	12/17/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva	
Ruth Ottley	1/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Grijalva Elementary	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Sean Davis	10/27/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Three students referred from AP	Pistor	
Sean Davis	10/28/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Group of four students with peer conflict	Pistor	
Sean Davis	10/29/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student improvement recognition	Pistor	
Sean Davis	10/29/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Three students peer conflict over missing iphone	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/3/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Four students continued drama peer conflict	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/4/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Honor Roll recognition planning	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Investigation and cleanup of restroom vandalism	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/7/2014	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Honor Roll Assemblies	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/7/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Break down of assembly	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/10/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Peer confict involving social media	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/11/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Working with new long term sub	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/13/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Peer conflict regarding sexual harrassment	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/13/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	New Sub	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/13/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Student improvement recognition	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/14/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Stolen backpack peer conflict	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/17/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Two students peer conflict	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Sub training	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Girl drama, 4 students	Pistor	
Sean Davis	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	3 Students out of class, working with teacher and students.	Pistor	
Select Your Name	12/12/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Think About It room	Wheeler	Student
Select Your Name	1/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		White	Student
Select Your Name	1/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Select Your Name	1/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mansfeld	Student
Select Your Name	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Student in crisis	Mansfeld	Student
Select Your Name	1/12/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mansfeld	Student
Select Your Name	1/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Mansfeld	Student
Select Your Name	1/9/2015	2	Select a Function	LSC Meeting	Project MORE	Student
Select Your Name	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	School Wide Assembly	Naylor	Student
Select Your Name	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	PBIS Student of the Month Luncheon	Naylor	Student
Select Your Name	1/21/2015	6	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	classroom lessons every SS class	Gridley	Student
Select Your Name	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		White	Student
Select Your Name	1/21/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Circle		Vail	Student
Select Your Name	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	1/22/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	1/26/2015	2.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	1/23/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	1/26/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	1/26/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Time Out	Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	1/26/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Consequence	ISS	Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Select Your Name	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Select Your Name	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Select Your Name	1/30/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	2/4/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	created behavior and accademic planning for students	Vail	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Select Your Name	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	performed 2 conferences with teachers, and students	Vail	Student
Select Your Name	2/4/2015	0.3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	student conference in reference to ditching	Vail	Student
Select Your Name	2/4/2015	3	Select a Function	MTSS complete and update forms	Vail	Other (Please
Select Your Name	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Falcon Buck STore rewards for positive behavior kindness slip distribution	Vail	Student
Select Your Name	2/3/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	2/9/2015	5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	2/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Grijalva	Student
Select Your Name	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Select Your Name	1/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student dent out of class	Hollinger	Student
Select Your Name	2/19/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Select Your Name	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	2/24/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Rodeo Pancake breakfast for students	Bloom	Student
Select Your Name	1/29/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice	parent / teacher conference	Valencia	Student
Select Your Name	3/2/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Miles	Student
Select Your Name	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Select Your Name	3/2/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Kindness club	Vail	Student
Select Your Name	3/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		White	Student
Select Your Name	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Grijalva	Student
Select Your Name	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Magee	Student
Select Your Name	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Select Your Name	3/9/2015	0	Select a Function		Select Your School	Student
Select Your Name	3/23/2015	8	Select a Function	AIMS Science preparation.	Santa Rita	Student
Select Your Name	3/24/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Drachman	Student
Select Your Name	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	3/31/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Warren	Student
Select Your Name	4/1/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Ford	Student
Select Your Name	4/14/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 sessions 5 students	Gridley	Student
Select Your Name	4/21/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	Update student 504 in Mojave	Bloom	Student
Select Your Name	4/9/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Pueblo Gardens	Student
Select Your Name	4/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	After suspension mediation	Mansfeld	Student
Select Your Name	4/8/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Bullying intervention	Mansfeld	Student
Select Your Name	4/9/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Mansfeld	Parent
Select Your Name	4/29/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sam Hughes	Student
Select Your Name	4/28/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	5/1/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Miles	Student
Select Your Name	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Dietz	Teacher
Select Your Name	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Student
Select Your Name	4/27/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vail	Student
Select Your Name	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document	Begin process for incoming Kinder next year	Johnson	Student
Select Your Name	5/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Wheeler	Student
Select Your Name	5/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	kindness club	Vail	Student
Select Your Name	5/8/2015	3.5	Select a Function	LSC meeting	Vail	Other (Please
Select Your Name	5/4/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Wheeler	Student
Select Your Name	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Select Your Name	5/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	prep perfect attendance certificates	Bloom	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Select Your Name	5/18/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition	MTSS	McCorkle	Student
Select Your Name	5/20/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Awards Assembly	McCorkle	Student
Select Your Name	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Met with Principal & boys for Restorative Consequences	Manzo	Student
Sonia Arvayo	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Restorative Practices	McCorkle	
Sonia Arvayo	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	7th graders destruction of property	McCorkle	
Sonia Arvayo	11/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Meeting with Social Worker and students on PBIS with 5th grade boy	McCorkle	
Sonia Arvayo	1/6/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	PBIS Stations and preparation	McCorkle	
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	1/7/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	ASA, B /D	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	1/8/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	ASA, B/D	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	1/9/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	ASA, B/D	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	1/15/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	MTSS, ASA	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	1/22/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Recognition	ASA, MTSS, B/D Attend	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	1/29/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	support for program, parent mtgs., MTSS	Marshall	Teacher
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	3/26/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice	consult with teachers, mtss, parent conference, conf. with CPS	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	3/27/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Conference	mtg. w/ La Frontera, restorative circle with class, conf. with parents	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	4/2/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	attendance, restorative circles	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	4/9/2015	8	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	MTSS, PBIS, Conf. w/ tchrs., direct contact with multiple students	Marshall	Student
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	5/4/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	home visit	Marshall	Parent
Sonnleitner, Dr. The	5/6/2015	8	B/D - Restorative Practice	CPS calls, work with challenging students	Marshall	Student
Speight-Clark	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/28/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/30/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/31/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/3/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/4/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/4/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/5/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	11/6/2014	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/7/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	11/7/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	11/13/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/14/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Speight-Clark	11/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/19/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	11/20/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/21/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	11/25/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/2/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/2/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/3/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	12/3/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	10/20/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/11/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/16/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/16/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/17/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/18/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	
Speight-Clark	12/18/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	
Speight-Clark	10/24/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Lineweaver	
Speight-Clark	1/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	
Speight-Clark	1/6/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	
Speight-Clark	1/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	
Speight-Clark	1/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/8/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/8/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/8/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/8/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Rainy day bus dismissal	Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/9/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/13/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/13/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/13/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/13/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/14/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/16/2015	4	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/21/2015	0	Select a Function	Did not work today	Select Your School	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/22/2015	0	Select a Function	Did not work today	Select Your School	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/23/2015	0	Select a Function	Did not work today	Select Your School	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/27/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	1/30/2015	0.25	Select a Function	emails	Lineweaver	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Parent
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Lineweaver	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/11/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/13/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/19/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Select Your School	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/19/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/20/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/20/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/20/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/20/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/20/2015	1	Select a Function	Lunch	Tully	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/23/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/24/2015	0.25	Select a Function	emails	Tully	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	2/25/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Select Your School	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/3/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/10/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	3/25/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/7/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/7/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/7/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/7/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/8/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/9/2015	0.25	Select a Function	emails	Tully	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/9/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/10/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/28/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/28/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/29/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/30/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/1/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/1/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/5/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Other (Please

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/12/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/14/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/14/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/15/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lineweaver	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lineweaver	Teacher
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/19/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/19/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/19/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/20/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lineweaver	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/21/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/21/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/21/2015	0.5	Select a Function	USP data	Tully	Other (Please
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/21/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Tully	Student
Speight-Clark, Lynne	5/22/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Tully	Teacher
Stacey Gist	11/20/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	
Stacey Gist	11/21/2014	30	B/D - Restorative Conference		Banks	
Stacey Gist	11/21/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	
Stacey Gist	11/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	
Stacey Gist	11/24/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Vesey	
Stacey Gist	11/26/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/5/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/8/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	
Stacey Gist	12/9/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	
Stacey Gist	12/11/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/15/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Vesey	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Stacey Gist	12/16/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Vesey	
Stacey Gist	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/18/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Banks	
Stacey Gist	12/19/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Banks	
Tammy Hille	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/27/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/3/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/21/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/4/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/5/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/5/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/5/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/6/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/6/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/7/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/7/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/10/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/10/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/14/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/18/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/19/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/19/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/20/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/20/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/21/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/25/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	11/26/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/22/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/1/2014	2.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/2/2014	0.45	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/23/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	10/23/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/12/2014	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Catalina	

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Tammy Hille	12/12/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/11/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/15/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/15/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/16/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tammy Hille	12/18/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Catalina	
Tanisha Tatum	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Robison	
Tanisha Tatum	11/21/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robison	
Tanisha Tatum	12/3/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	11/17/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	11/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	
Tanisha Tatum	11/20/2014	3.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	11/18/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robison	
Tanisha Tatum	11/17/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	11/13/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	11/6/2014	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	11/26/2014	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robison	
Tanisha Tatum	12/1/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Borton	
Tanisha Tatum	12/5/2014	1.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robison	
Tatum, Tanisha	1/12/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Other (Please
Tatum, Tanisha	1/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	1/20/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/22/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/22/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	1/28/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	1/29/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/30/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	1/29/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	2/5/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	2/6/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/17/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Other (Please
Tatum, Tanisha	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Teacher
Tatum, Tanisha	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/13/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/12/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/19/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Teacher
Tatum, Tanisha	2/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student

Name	Date Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Tatum, Tanisha	2/24/2015	2 B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Parent
Tatum, Tanisha	2/23/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	2/25/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	3/25/2015	1.5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	3/25/2015	1.5 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	3/27/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	3/27/2015	2.5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	3/30/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Practice		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	3/31/2015	2 B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/1/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/23/2015	1.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/27/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/27/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/27/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/28/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/29/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Circle		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	4/30/2015	2.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Robison	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	5/7/2015	2 B/D - Restorative Conference		Borton	Student
Tatum, Tanisha	5/13/2015	1.5 B/D - Restorative Practice		Robison	Student
Theresa Sonnleitner	10/29/2014	8 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Marshall	
Theresa Sonnleitner	11/5/2014	8 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Conf. w/parent, conf. w/prin., MTSS meeting, rest. circle	Marshall	
Theresa Sonnleitner	11/20/2014	8 B/D - Restorative Circle	PBIS Planning, Multiple Beh. Interv., Curric., PBIS Planning	Marshall	
Thomas, Carol	1/13/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/13/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	1/12/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/14/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Lawrence	Teacher
Thomas, Carol	1/21/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Conference		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/22/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/22/2015	2 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Download, burn, and prepare student made Anti-bullying video for presentation to parents	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	1/23/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/29/2015	1.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/29/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Circle		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	1/29/2015	1 B/D - PBIS Recognition		Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	1/29/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Practice		Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	2/5/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/6/2015	0.75 B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/6/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Practice	Whole class meeting about respect	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/6/2015	1.5 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Creating check in/out behavior chart and meeting with teacher.	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	2/10/2015	0.5 B/D - Restorative Conference		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/11/2015	1.5 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Committee meeting, typing minutes and emailing to staff	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	2/11/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Circle	Held class meeting about honesty	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/11/2015	1.5 B/D - Restorative Conference	Individual and restorative conference, parent conference	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	2/12/2015	0.5 B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Adjusting reward systems for 7th and 8th grade	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/12/2015	0.5 B/D - PBIS Recognition	Met with middle school students to discuss new reward system	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/13/2015	1 B/D - Restorative Conference	Held 3 individual conferences with students	Lawrence	Student

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Thomas, Carol	2/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	2/25/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/2/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two different situations	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/5/2015	1.15	B/D - Restorative Conference	Dealt with 5 behavior issues	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Individual conference with 3 different students for behavior	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/12/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Held three restorative conferences and 3 individual conferences with students	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	3/25/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two behavior issues and one parent contact	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	4/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	4/21/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	4/28/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	4 students	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	4/30/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 students	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/1/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice	Went to playground to work with students on playground behavior and language	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/5/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Dealt with one student off and on all day who continually left his classroom.	Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/6/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Collecting and analyzing student behavior	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/7/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Analyzing behavior data	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	Met with a group of 6 students to acknowledge positive behavior in the classroom	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/8/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	three students,three different occurrences	Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/11/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Data collection on behavior	Lawrence	Other (Please
Thomas, Carol	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Two students, two different situations	Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Lawrence	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Johnson	Student
Thomas, Carol	5/18/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Johnson	Student
Thompson, Paul	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	3/27/2015	5	Select a Function	Quarterly Parent Mtg final set up and event	Rose	Parent
Thompson, Paul	5/1/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rose	Teacher

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Thompson, Paul	5/7/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/7/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/8/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rose	Student
Thompson, Paul	5/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Rose	Student
Valenzuela, Andrea	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Valenzuela, Andrea	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Valenzuela, Andrea	1/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Tucson High	Student
Valenzuela, Andrea	2/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Tucson High	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/14/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/14/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/16/2015	6.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/20/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/21/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/22/2015	30	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/23/2015	2.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/26/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Practice	Restorative Practices Training	Maldonado	Other (Please
Vella, Mercedes	1/26/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/27/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/28/2015	6.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Teacher
Vella, Mercedes	1/29/2015	5.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	1/29/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	1/30/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/5/2015	5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/6/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/9/2015	0.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/11/2015	5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/17/2015	0	B/D - Restorative Circle		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/17/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	2/19/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Teacher
Vella, Mercedes	2/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	3/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	3/5/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	3/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	3/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	3/11/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	3/23/2015	2	B/D - PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Maldonado	Parent

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Vella, Mercedes	3/27/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Teacher
Vella, Mercedes	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Maldonado	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	3/30/2015	0.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	3/30/2015	1.5	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Maldonado	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	3/31/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Maldonado	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	4/1/2015	2	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	4/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/2/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Parent
Vella, Mercedes	4/2/2015	4	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/2/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/9/2015	1	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/22/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/30/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	4/30/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	5/1/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	5/13/2015	2.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	5/14/2015	4	B/D – PBIS 504 Organize/Plan/Document		Davis	Teacher
Vella, Mercedes	5/14/2015	2	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	5/15/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Davis	Student
Vella, Mercedes	5/19/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Maldonado	Student
Vella, Mercedes	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Davis	Student
Veronica Vironet	8/1/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	w/ Admin	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	8/8/2014	3	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Cohort Connections	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	8/8/2014	4	B/D - Student GSRR Presentation	Cohort Connection	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	11/24/2014	0.25	B/D - PBIS Recognition		PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	w/student and teacher	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/4/2014	3	B/D - Restorative Circle	in class 5th & 7th-mendi	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/16/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		PMHS, LRR	
Veronica Vironet	9/17/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	6 period-	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/15/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Student complaint about teacher bullying	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/24/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Student conference	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	8/4/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	drugs/ditching/parent contact	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	anger issues	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/13/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	behavior contract/ditching	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Behavior contract/ditching/	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/19/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	behavior contract/ditching/gangs/parent contact	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/24/2014	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	parent/student conflict-b/f & g/f issues	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	referred by	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/22/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	parent/student	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/31/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/12/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	7th period	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student & teacher	PMHS	

Name	Date Work	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Veronica Vironet	9/8/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student bullying	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/9/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	gangs/ditching/attendance/parent contact-	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/14/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	/relationship issues	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student/teacher mediation	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/15/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	mediation	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	10/17/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	mediation-	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/30/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	mediation-	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	W/ student on drugs...	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/3/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	parent/student withdraw	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/2/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	behavior contract	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/4/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Mediation 2 students	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/4/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	with student, parent, ...till 5 pm	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/4/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	talked with student who was being harrassed	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/8/2014	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	parent, student, counselor, drop out prevention-student status	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	12/12/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	student mediation-fight	PMHS	
Veronica Vironet	9/18/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	behavior contract/ditching/Laboring/parent contact	PMHS	
Wanda Buchana	11/12/2014	2	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	PBIS Training	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	10/24/2014	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition	PBIS Student of the Month Luncheon	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/12/2014	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with about an incident that took place a few minutes ago.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/13/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	10/13/2014	2.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conference with about his recent behavior.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/21/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/20/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Conducted a Circle in a 5th Grade Classroom	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	12/5/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conducted a conference with some 6th grade students.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	10/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Restorative conference with	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	10/21/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Planned PBIS Student Luncheon	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	10/24/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Met with a parent concerning her son being recognized as a PBIS Student of the Month.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	12/17/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conferece with two students	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conferenced with students.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	12/18/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Conferenced with students.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	1/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	10/27/2014	0.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations	Met with some students to remind them of the school's expectations	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/3/2014	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	11/6/2014	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with Students, Behavior Specialist and Mentors to resolve the issues between the students.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Wanda Buchanan	12/16/2014	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conference with a student along with Community Mentors and Principal.	Roberts/Naylor K-8	
Williams, Bruce	1/9/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice	Participate on Circle in Mr. Jihson's Class	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/9/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	With Student	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/12/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	meeting with student on a Return from suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/14/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Student return from Suspension, P.C. and follow up with	Select Your School	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/16/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with 5 boys today to help with a conflict between them	Sabino	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Williams, Bruce	1/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with [redacted] on his Return from Suspension.	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Stopped by to let me know his friend should be bothered by something [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/21/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with [redacted] and [redacted] followed up with a phone msg home	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Return from Suspension for [redacted] and [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/21/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with [redacted] and [redacted] to make sure there was no problem with [redacted] phone issue	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with [redacted] she had lied to her teacher about being at the counseling office instead she was ditching class	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	a student had reported some bulling in their 1st period class	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/26/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference	Several students had been invovled in a situation in Ms. Carpenter's class 1st period	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/27/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted] a student had been looking- staring at him	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	1/28/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Pre conference with [redacted] RE: situation with [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with [redacted] upon her return from suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/2/2015	2.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	With, [redacted] and [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	return from suspension meetings	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/9/2015	0.45	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met With [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/9/2015	1.25	Select a Function	Prep for African American Heritage Day Field trip	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	With [redacted] and [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/11/2015	0.25	Select a Function	Parent meeting for African American Trip information	Sabino	Parent
Williams, Bruce	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with [redacted] return from suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with Student upon thier return to school from supension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/16/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted] and [redacted] seprate meetings	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Meet wit 2 girls [redacted] successful meeting	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/19/2015	2	Select a Function	After School Homework help	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/25/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Abyence contact meeting with [redacted], also gave her a time tracker	Select Your School	Student
Williams, Bruce	2/25/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition	2 student selcted to go to the Metropolitan Education Commission Student Lobby Day	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/2/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with [redacted] x 2	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted] Dicuss Decisions and [redacted] on class decisions	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/3/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted] return from suspension meeting	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/3/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with [redacted] and follow up on [redacted] Suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/10/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted] Mom Phone call	Sabino	Parent
Williams, Bruce	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	[redacted]	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	3/12/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 boys in Mr. Abney's class causing disrutions and not following class policy's plus follow up with [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/12/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Follow up on [redacted]	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	Prep- Make plan on goals and questions for the group met with 4 periods of Band students. Teacher change and students were encouraged to share how this has effected them and what they were willing to do to help strive to have a successful situation	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/26/2015	4	B/D - Restorative Circle	follow up meetings with various students from the classroom circles	Sabino	Student

Name	Date Work	P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Williams, Bruce	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	with 2 students returning from suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	Student teacher circle	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Return from suspension meeting for	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	3/31/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	2 students conflict resolution. Met with students individually	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	4/1/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Follow up with 2 students from previous day,	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	4/6/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with Student upon his return from suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	4/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	With from Ms. Chun's class	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	4/23/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meet with Ms. Chun for follow up meeting	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	4/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	Follow up on return from suspension	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	4/24/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle	5 students from Ms. Chun's Class	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Prep with teacher and then follow up after the circle, previously logged	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	4/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Prep with teacher and then follow up after the circle, previously logged	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	4/30/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	follow up with Ms. Chun	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Derogatory comment sent out of class for not cooperating and using a	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/4/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	return from Suspension Meeting, student was not cooperative	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/4/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Meeting with Mr. Abney on holding his students accountable	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	5/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Met with she was sent to office for not cooperating with the teacher	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	attempted but student was very loud and angry would not cooperate	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/6/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	With Teacher for	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	with teacher	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	5/7/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	with student per Ms. Mali's request	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/11/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	Return from Suspension meeting for gave student his paper work and he apologized to Ms. Ronsoman	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/12/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	restorative meeting return from suspension, "making things right"	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	-	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/14/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Ms. Yslas Request for student intervention	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Also consult with issues of personal nature "family loss"	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	With Teacher Mr. Kissel for Monday parent meeting	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference	With	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle	For mom and	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	for also followed up with did not show up when sent call slip	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/18/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Pre conference and Post with Teacher and separate with mother as well	Sabino	Other (Please
Williams, Bruce	5/19/2015	1	Select a Function	Emails	Sabino	Teacher
Williams, Bruce	5/20/2015	0.25	B/D - Restorative Conference	Return from Suspension meeting with	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/20/2015	0.25	Select a Function	Print unofficial transcript for	Sabino	Student
Williams, Bruce	5/20/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference	reported to me had an issue in Ms. Mullet's class this morning. I kept him all of 3rd period and after he finished his test I held another restorative meeting with him	Sabino	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Wilson, Carol	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	1/16/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle	2 conflicts with students mediated in lieu of suspension	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	1/27/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual conferences with different students regarding grades and personal concerns	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Conflict Mediation	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Mediation of students after suspension	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/5/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conflict Mediation in lieu of suspension	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Conflict mediation	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Student and teacher conference	Mansfeld	Other (Please
Wilson, Carol	2/11/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Consequence	Mediation of students after suspension	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/19/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition	PBIS recognition assemblies	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	conflict mediation	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	2/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice	Mediation with students returning from suspension	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	Bullying mediation	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	3/25/2015	30	B/D - Restorative Practice	Individual conference with student	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	3/25/2015	30	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference	conflict mediation	Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	4/2/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Mansfeld	Student
Wilson, Carol	4/9/2015	4	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning	Prepare for Parent Honor Roll Assembly	Mansfeld	Parent
Wilson, Carol	4/10/2015	3	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Mansfeld	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/9/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/13/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/14/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/15/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/16/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/16/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/20/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/20/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/21/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/21/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/22/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/22/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/27/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/27/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/27/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/27/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	Parent
Worthington, Evan	1/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sam Hughes	Student

Name	Date Work P	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Worthington, Evan	1/28/2015	0.5	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/28/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/29/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/29/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	1/30/2015	1.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/2/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/2/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/4/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/3/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/3/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/3/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/3/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/5/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/5/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/6/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/9/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/9/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Teacher
Worthington, Evan	2/10/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/10/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Teacher Behavior Expectations		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/12/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/12/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/13/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/13/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/16/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/16/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/16/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/17/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/17/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/18/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Practice		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	Teacher
Worthington, Evan	2/19/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/20/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/20/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/23/2015	2	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/23/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	2/24/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/23/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/23/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/24/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/25/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/26/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student

Name	Date	Work P. Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Worthington, Evan	3/26/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	3/31/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/6/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/6/2015	1.5	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/7/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/9/2015	3	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/10/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/15/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/22/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/24/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/27/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/27/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/28/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/28/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/29/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/30/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	4/30/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/1/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/1/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Consequence		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/1/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/4/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/4/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/5/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/5/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/6/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/8/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/11/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/11/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Conference		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/12/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/12/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/14/2015	0.75	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/13/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/14/2015	1.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Select Your School	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/14/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/15/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/15/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/15/2015	0.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/18/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Sam Hughes	Teacher
Worthington, Evan	5/18/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/18/2015	0.75	B/D - Restorative Practice		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/19/2015	1.5	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/19/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Whitmore	Student

Name	Date Work P.	Hours	Function	"Other Function" Detail	School Site:	Intended Audience
Worthington, Evan	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/20/2015	1	B/D - PBIS Recognition		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/20/2015	2.25	B/D - Restorative Conference		Whitmore	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/21/2015	1	B/D - Restorative Circle		Sam Hughes	Student
Worthington, Evan	5/22/2015	1.25	B/D - PBIS Organization/Planning		Whitmore	Student